Date Opened:

January 18, 2012

BIDS No. 2012-80-1
"3 Month Contract for Copier Paper

Executive Office Supply
c/o Juanita Fontaine
3312 Santa Ursula Ave
Laredo, TX 78040

956-722-6791

Patria Office St
c/o Luis Gonza
301 E. Calton F
Laredo, TX 780
956-723-2332

Toner, & Ink Cartridges" executiv@netscorp.net patriamaria2 @
Primary
Est. | UOM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT Extended UNIT
Qty. PRICE PRICE PRICE
Price Form - Copier Paper
150 Cs. |Copier Paper- Letter Size Navigator 99
Brightness $35.00 $5,250.00 $38.90
20 Cs. |Copier Paper —Xerox Legal Size 8 %5 x 14 $50.00 $1,000.00 $52.90
20 Cs. |Copier Paper- Discovery Ledger Size 11 x17
$40.00 $800.00 $45.90
10 Ream |Copier Paper 8 % x11 ( 500 sheet p/ ream)
Canary $4.55 $45.50 $4.19
10 Ream |Copier Paper 8 % x11 ( 500 sheet p/ ream) Tan
$4.55 $45.50 $4.29
10 Ream |Copier Paper 8 % x11 ( 500 sheet p/ ream)
Salmon $4.55 $45.50 $4.29
10 Ream |Copier Paper 8 % x11 ( 500 sheet p/ ream)
GoldenRod $4.55 $45.50 $4.19
10 Ream |Copier Paper 8 % x11 ( 500 sheet p/ ream)
Gray $4.55 $45.50 $4.29
10 Ream |Copier Paper 8 % x11 ( 500 sheet p/ ream)
Ivory $4.55 $45.50 $4.29
10 Ream |Copier Paper 8 % x11 ( 500 sheet p/ ream) Buff
$4.55 $45.50 $4.29
10 Ream |Copier Paper 8 % x11 ( 500 sheet p/ ream)
Orchid $4.55 $45.50 $4.29
10 Ream |Copier Paper 8 % x 11( 500 sheet p/ream) Green
$4.55 $45.50 $4.19
10 Ream |Cardstock White 250 sheets p/ream $8.99 $89.90 $9.19
10 Ream |Cardstock Ivory 250 sheets p/ream $8.99 $89.90 $7.99
10 Ream |Cardstock Canary 250 Sheets p/ream $8.99 $89.90 $7.99
10 Ream |Cardstock Pink 250 sheets p/ream $8.99 $89.90 $7.99
10 Ream |Cardstock Blue 250 sheets p/ream $8.99 $89.90 $7.99
10 Ream |Cardstock Green 250 sheets p/ream $8.99 $89.90 $7.99
10 Ream |Cardstock Peach 250 sheets p/ream $10.40 $104.00 $7.99
10 Ream |Cardstock Orchid 250 sheets p/ream $8.99 $89.90 $7.99
10 Ream |Cardstock Golden Rod 250 Sheets p/ream $10.40 $104.00 $7.99
Total Copier Paper $8,296.80

Ink Cartridges
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Date Opened:

January 18, 2012

BIDS No. 2012-80-1
"3 Month Contract for Copier Paper

Executive Office Supply
c/o Juanita Fontaine
3312 Santa Ursula Ave
Laredo, TX 78040

956-722-6791

Patria Office St
c/o Luis Gonza
301 E. Calton F
Laredo, TX 780
956-723-2332

Toner, & Ink Cartridges" executiv@netscorp.net patriamaria2 @
Primary

Est. | UOM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT Extended UNIT

Qty. PRICE PRICE PRICE
5 Ea |HP CE250 A Black $119.00 $595.00 $117.69
5 Ea |HP CE251 A Blue $230.00 $1,150.00 $230.69
5 Ea |HP CE253 A Magenta $230.00 $1,150.00 $230.69
5 Ea |HP CE252 A Yellow $230.00 $1,150.00 $230.69
13 Ea |HP49X $145.00 $1,885.00 $145.49
10 Ea |HP53A $78.90 $789.00 $77.69
5 Ea |HPOS5A $72.90 $364.50 $77.00
5 Ea |HP56 $21.00 $105.00 $20.49
5 Ea |HP57 $33.50 $167.50 $32.99
5 Ea |HP58 $25.90 $129.50 $24.99
5 Ea |HPQG647A $129.95 $649.75 $127.90
5 Ea |HPQ7581A $165.00 $825.00 $164.69
5 Ea |HPQ7582A $165.00 $825.00 $164.69
5 Ea [|HPQ7583A $165.00 $825.00 $164.69
5 Ea |HPO2-Cyan $9.15 $45.75 $9.49
5 Ea |HPO2-Light Cyan $9.15 $45.75 $9.49
5 Ea |HP02-Magenta $9.15 $45.75 $9.49
5 Fa_|HP0D-licht Magenta $9.15 $45.75 $9.49
5 Ea [|HPO2-Yellow $9.15 $45.75 $9.49
5 Ea |HPO02-Black $17.60 $88.00 $17.49
5 Ea |HP 95 & 98 (Black & Color Combo) $44.90 $224.50 $43.49
5 Ea |HP 14 Tricolor $29.90 $149.50 $49.49
5 Ea |HP15 Black $29.00 $145.00 $28.99
5 Ea |HP 17 Tricolor $31.50 $157.50 $30.49
5 Ea |HP 20 Black $31.50 $157.50 $30.49
5 Ea |HP 23 Tricolor $37.00 $185.00 $37.90
5 Ea |HP 88 Yellow $13.75 $68.75 $13.69
5 Ea |HP 29 Black $32.90 $164.50 $32.69
5 Ea |HP 49 Tricolor $34.50 $172.50 $32.69
5 Ea |HP 57 Tricolor $23.00 $115.00 $65.99
5 Ea |HP 58 Photo $27.00 $135.00 $24.99
5 Ea |Canon BCI 21 Black $1.99 $9.95 $20.00

Total Ink Catridges $12,611.70
Toner

5 Ea |Toshiba E-Studio 12A9635 $195.00 $975.00 $182.00
5 Ea |Toshiba E-Studio 12A9645 $195.00 $975.00 $182.00
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Date Opened: January 18, 2012 Executive Office Supply Patria Office St
c/o Juanita Fontaine c/o Luis Gonza
3312 Santa Ursula Ave 301 E. Calton F
BIDS No. 2012-80-1 Laredo, TX 78040 Laredo, TX 780
"3 Month Contract for Copier Paper 956-722-6791 956-723-2332
Toner, & Ink Cartridges" executiv@netscorp.net patriamaria2 @
Primary
Est. UoM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT Extended UNIT
Qty. PRICE PRICE PRICE
5 Ea |Toshiba E-Studio 12A9640 $195.00 $975.00 $182.00
5 Ea |HP Color Laser Jet 2605dn Q6000 A Black $67.00 $335.00 $74.69
5 Ea |HP Color Laser Jet 2605dn Q6002 A Yellow $79.90 $399.50 $81.49
5 Ea |HP Color Laser Jet 2605dn Q6001 A Cyan $79.90 $399.50 $81.49
5 Ea |HP Color Laser Jet 2605dn Q 6003 A Magenta
$79.90 $399.50 $81.49
5 Ea |HP Laser Jet 1320 49A-Q5949A $79.90 $399.50 $81.49
5 Ea |HP Laser Jet 1320 49X — Q5949X $148.00 $740.00 $145.49
5 Ea |HP Laser Jet P2055dn 05A-CE505A $72.00 $360.00 $76.90
5 Ea |HP CE505A Black $72.00 $360.00 $76.90
5 Ea |HP Q6470a Black $123.00 $615.00 $127.90
5 Ea |HPQ7583A Magenta $166.00 $830.00 $164.29
5 Ea |HPQ7582A Yellow $166.00 $830.00 $164.29
5 Ea |HPQ7581A Cyan $166.00 $830.00 $164.29
5 Ea |HP49A (Q5949A) Laser Jet 1320 $81.00 $405.00 $79.69
5 Ea |HP96A (C4096A) Laser Jet 2200 $119.00 $595.00 $111.69
5 Ea |HP CC532 A Yellow- Laser Jet CP2025 $107.00 $535.00 $105.69
5 Ea |HP CC533 A Magenta- Laser Jet CP2025 $107.00 $535.00 $105.69
5 Ea |HP 53A (Q7553A) Laser Jet P2015 $78.00 $390.00 $77.90
5 Ea |HP 98A LaserJet 92298A $121.00 $605.00 $121.79
5 Ea |HP C9720 A - Black Laser Jet 4600dn $171.00 $855.00 $172.00
5 Ea |HP C9721 A- Cyan Laser Jet 4600dn $233.00 $1,165.00 $233.00
5 Ea |HP C9722 A—Yellow Laser Jet 4600dn $233.00 $1,165.00 $233.00
5 Ea |HP C9723 A — Magenta Laser Jet 4600dn $233.00 $1,165.00 $233.00
5 Ea |HP Q3960 A - Black $79.90 $399.50 $79.79
5 Ea |Hp Q3961 A- Cyan $96.90 $484.50 $96.25
5 Ea |HP Q3962 A- Yellow $96.90 $484.50 $96.25
5 Ea |HP Q3963 A - Magenta $96.90 $484.50 $96.25
5 Ea |HPOS5A HP Laser Jet P 2035 $75.00 $375.00 $76.90
5 Ea |HP Laser Jet Q5470A — Black $123.00 $615.00 $78.69
5 Ea |HP 49A Q 5949A $79.90 $399.50 $79.69
5 Ea |HP13 AQ2613A $79.90 $399.50 $79.69
5 Ea |HP C9700A —Black $79.90 $399.50 $79.69
5 Ea |HP C9701A- Cyan $97.00 $485.00 $96.25
5 Ea |HP C9702A- Yellow $97.00 $485.00 $96.25
5 Ea |HP C9703A -Magenta $97.00 $485.00 $96.25
5 Ea |HP Q3971A- Cyan $72.00 $360.00 $70.99
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Date Opened:

January 18, 2012

BIDS No. 2012-80-1
"3 Month Contract for Copier Paper

3312 Santa U

956-722-6791

Executive Office Supply
c/o Juanita Fontaine

rsula Ave

Laredo, TX 78040

Patria Office St
c/o Luis Gonza
301 E. Calton F
Laredo, TX 780
956-723-2332

Toner, & Ink Cartridges" executiv@netscorp.net patriamaria2 @
Primary
Est. UOM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT Extended UNIT
Qty. PRICE PRICE PRICE
5 Ea |HP Q3972A- Yellow $72.00 $360.00 $70.99
5 Ea |HP Q3973A- Magenta $72.00 $360.00 $70.99
5 Ea |HP42X-—Mass Printing $218.00 $1,090.00 $219.00
5 Ea |HP92A $69.90 $349.50 $68.79
Total Toners $24,854.00

Grand Total for Paper, Ink Catridges, & Toner} $45,762.50

Discount for supplies not on Price Form 20-30%

"No Bid" "Discontinued" items have been removed from final tallies
5 Ea |Canon BCI 21 Color $2.10 $10.50 disc
5 Ea [Canon BC-20 Disc. $0.00 disc
5 Ea [|Canon BC-02 $23.00 $115.00 disc
5 Ea |Lexmark 1382050 Disc. disc
5 Ea |[Lexmark 1382060 Disc. disc
5 Ea |HPO5A (CE505A) Laser Jet P2035 $72.00 $360.00 no bid
5 Ea |Hp15A (C7115A) Laser Jet 1200 $69.90 $349.50 no bid
5 Ea |HP CC530 A Black- Laser Jet CP2025 $109.00 $545.00 no bid
5 Ea |HP CC531 A Cyan- Laser Jet CP2025 $107.00 $535.00 no bid
5 Ea |HP 419CA $79.90 $399.50 Disc
5 Ea [Toshiba E-Studio 24B2069 $109.00 $545.00 disc
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BIDS No. 2012-80-1

Date Opened: January 18, 2012

"3 Month Contract for Copier Paper

Executive Office Supply
c/o Juanita Fontaine
3312 Santa Ursula Ave
Laredo, TX 78040
956-722-6791

Patria Office St
c/o Luis Gonza
301 E. Calton F
Laredo, TX 780
956-723-2332

Toner, & Ink Cartridges" executiv@netscorp.net patriamaria2 @
Primary
Est. UOM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT Extended UNIT
Qty. PRICE PRICE PRICE
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apply
lez
.
141

yahoo.com

TOTAL
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

$5,835.00

$1,058.00

$918.00

$41.90

$42.90

$42.90

$41.90

$42.90

$42.90

$42.90

$42.90

$41.90

$91.90

$79.90

$79.90

$79.90

$79.90

$79.90

$79.90

$79.90

$79.90

$8,925.20
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TOTAL
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

$588.45

$1,153.45

$1,153.45

$1,153.45

$1,891.37

$776.90

$385.00

$102.45

$164.95

$124.95

$639.50

$823.45

$823.45

$823.45

$47.45

$47.45

$47.45

$47.45

$47.45

$87.45

$217.45

$247.45

$144.95

$152.45

$152.45

$189.50

$68.45

$163.45

$163.45

$329.95

$124.95

$100.00

$12,983.47

$910.00

$910.00
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TOTAL
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

$910.00

$373.45

$407.45

$407.45

$407.45

$407.45

$727.45

$384.50

$384.50

$639.50

$821.45

$821.45

$821.45

$398.45

$558.45

$528.45

$528.45

$389.50

$608.95

$860.00

$1,165.00

$1,165.00

$1,165.00

$398.95

$481.25

$481.25

$481.25

$384.50

$393.45

$398.45

$398.45

$398.45

$481.25

$481.25

$481.25

$354.95
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TOTAL
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

$354.95

$354.95

$1,095.00

$343.95

$24,464.35

$46,373.02

25%

Page 9 of 10




apply
lez
.

141

yahoo.com
TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
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