
Opened: July 21, 2009
Bid Number:2010-06

Fleet Pride O' Reilly Auto Parts Battery Service Gonzalez Auto Parts
BIDS FOR: 123 Flecha Lane 233 S. Patterson 3808 San Bernardo 4220 San Bernardo

Laredo, Texas 78045 Springfield, M0 65802 Laredo, Texas 78041 Laredo, Texas 78041
"Annual Contract for Motor Vehicle Batteries"

Secondary Primary

Raymundo Maldonado Doug Wallis Sam Sanchez Jose Gage Jr.
Branch Manager Manager President
(956)722-0761 (417) 862-2674-X-8402 956-722-6703 956-726-9766

ITEM QTY ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

1 24-F (C.C.A. 525)  C.A. 630 48.23$           EXIDE 51.40$           CCA 550/ SSB 56.95$           Continental Batteris 48.00$           EXIDE
24F- 60 24R72 24F-60

2 24-F-5 (C.C.A. 650) No Bid EXIDE 65.26$           CCA930 56.95$           63.00$           EXIDE
24R72 24F-84N

3 31-S (C.C.A. 925) 77.72$           EXIDE 76.96$           CCA1000 79.72$           77.00$           EXIDE
F315-800 31-5

4 31-P (C.C.A. 700) 65.80$           EXIDE 63.09$           CCA760 71.40$           65.50$           EXIDE
F31S - 800 31-4 

5 36-R (C.C.A. 650) 59.95$           EXIDE 59.97$           CCA650 62.30$           59.00$           EXIDE
36R - 72 36R72

6 31-S (C.C.A. 925) 77.72$           EXIDE 76.96$           CCA1000 79.72$           77.00$           EXIDE
F31S - 1000 31-5T

7 31-P (C.C.A. 700) 65.80$           EXIDE 63.09$           CCA760 71.40$           65.50$           EXIDE
F315S-800 31-4 

8 34-(C.C.A 630) 55.20$           51.40$           CCA690 63.95$           56.00$           EXIDE
34-60 34-72

9 34- (C.C.A 750) 66.92$           59.61$           CCA800 63.95$           67.00$           EXIDE
34R-84N 34EXT

10 36-R (C.C.A. 650) 59.95$           EXIDE 59.97$           CCA650 62.30$           59.00$           EXIDE
36R-72 36R72

11 65 (C.C.A. 900) 69.20$           EXIDE 76.90$           CCA880 CA1040 70.30$           68.00$           EXIDE
F-65-HP 65-60

12 4 DR (C.C.A 900) 125.47$         EXIDE 112.08$         CCA900 AD2 130.20$         125.00$         EXIDE
FD-4 4D2
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13 58 (C.C.A 540) 67.36$           EXIDE 59.61$           CCA540 67.30$           67.00$           EXIDE
F58-84N 58EXT

14 65 (C.C.A 875) 69.20$           EXIDE 76.90$           CCA880 70.30$           68.00$           EXIDE
F65-HP 65-60

15 78 (C.C.A 770) 78.71$           EXIDE 59.61$           CCA800 77.30$           77.00$           EXIDE
F78-84 78 Ext

16 8-D (C.C.A 1300) 144.84$         EXIDE 144.69$         CCA1375 146.55$         143.00$         EXIDE
F8D-1300 8D3

17 3-T (C.C.A 460) No Bid EXIDE No Bid Super Starter 78.00$           77.00$           EXIDE
3et

18 BH-50 No Bid EXIDE No Bid Super Starter N/A 100.00$         EXIDE
50-72

GRAND TOTAL: Inc Inc 1,308.59$      1,362.00$      
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