Opened: September 21, 2010
Bid Number 2011-07

BIDS FOR:

"Annual Contract for Heavy Equipment Parts"

Holt Cat
14300 Fm 1472
Laredo, Tx 78046

RDO Equipment
5615 St. Hwy 359 E
Laredo, Texas 78045

Primary

Enrigue Aldape Lorenzo Soliz/Lead Parts
(956) 722-0075 956-718-1909
ITEM[QTY ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

ITEM A: TIPES & BLADES

1 5|TIP CATERPILLAR 1U3252 $ 4263 | $ 21315 | $ 2460 | $ 123.00
LESS 15%

2 6|TIP CATERPILLAR 1U3302 $ 4762 | $ 285.72 | $ 4244 | $ 254.64
LESS 15%

3 4(TIP CATERPILLAR 640309 $ 63.58 [ $ 25432 | $ 46.75 | $ 187.00
LESS 15%

4 7|BLADES CATERPILLAR T74863 NO BID $ 61.14 [ $ 427.98
1/2X8X7 3/4 HOLE

5 5| RETAINER 1U2405 $ 890 (9% 4450 | $ 3.081% 15.44
LESS 15%

6 3| PIN 8E6259 $ 8.08 9% 2424 [ $ 3511% 10.53
LESS 15%

7 9] RETAINER 3J9609 NO BID $ 183 (% 16.20

8 6[PIN 107-3308 $ 436 ($ 1744 | $ 145 % 8.70
LESS 15%

9 10(BOLT 5J4773 $ 274 | $ 2740 $ 082|$% 8.24
LESS 15%
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Bid Number 2011-07
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"Annual Contract for Heavy Equipment Parts"

Holt Cat

14300 Fm 1472
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10 10|INUT 233506 $ 1411 % 1410 ( $ 028 |$% 2.79
LESS 15%
11 6(TIP L100896 NO BID NO BID
12 8|BLADE 8D2786 CAT $ 10285 | $ 82280 | $ 61.24 | $ 48.99
LESS 15%
13 6(BLADE T74842 RDO OR WAUKESA NO BID $ 55.18 | $ 331.08
14 5(BLADE 7D-1158 $ 18294 | $ 914.70 | $ 94.56 | $ 567.39
LESS 15%
15 6|BLADE-MOTOR GRADER 8D-2787 $ 11758 | $ 70548 | $ 70.63 | $ 423.75
LESS 15%
16 8|BLADE-CASE BACKHOES NO BID $ 165.00 ($ 1,320.00
112946A1
17 7|BLADE -BRUSH HOG 67743 NO BID $ 3852 | % 269.64
18 10|BLADE-BRUSH HOG 67744 NO BID $ 35.96 | $ 359.60
19 5(BLADE-BRUSH HOG 7919 NO BID $ 1321 ($ 66.05
20 7{JAM NUT-BRUSH HOG 252 NO BID $ 185|% 12.95
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21 8[LOCK WASHER -BRUSH HOG 20322 NO BID $ 095($% 7.60
22 3|CUTTING EDGE-BULL DOZER $ 19235 | % 577.05| $ 188.64 | $ 565.92
9W-1878
LESS 15%
23 5(END BITS-BULL DOZER 9W-8874 $ 9599 | $ 479.90 | $ 9413 | $ 47.07
24 10|END BITS-BULL DOZER 9W-8875 $ 9598 | $ 959.80 | $ 9413 | $ 941.30
LESS 15%
25 9[CUTTING EDGE-EARTH SCRAPER $ 138.67 | $ 1,248.40 | $ 13599 |$ 1,223.91
4T7-6613
LESS 15%
26 10|CUTTING EDGE-EARTH SCRAPER $ 25494 | $ 254940 | $ 250.02 |$ 2,500.20
4T-6611
LESS 15%
27 6({TOOTH-MOTOR GRADER 9937 NO BID NO BID
28 6{PIN-MOTOR GRADER 9938 NO BID NO BID
29 5[SHANK-MOTOR GRADER 8110 NO BID NO BID
30 6|RIPPER TOOTH-MOTOR GRADER $ 1775 [ $ 106.50 | NO BID
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Opened: September 21, 2010
Bid Number 2011-07

Holt Cat RDO Equipment
BIDS FOR: 14300 Fm 1472 5615 St. Hwy 359 E
Laredo, Tx 78046 Laredo, Texas 78045
"Annual Contract for Heavy Equipment Parts" |
Primary
Enrigue Aldape Lorenzo Soliz/Lead Parts
(956) 722-0075 956-718-1909
ITEM[QTY ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
195-7234
LESS 15%
31 6/TOOTH-EARTH SCRAPER 352HX NO BID $ 3166 (% 189.96
32 3|PIN JOHN DEERE FRONT LOADER $ 3841 % 1152 | $ 131 (% 3.93
132-4763
LESS 15%
33 4|WASHER-JOHN DEERE FRONT LOADER | $ 963 | % 3852 (% 2851 % 11.41
149-5733
LESS 15%
34 5|TOOTH-963 TRACK LOADER 1U03302 $ 37.24 [ $ 186.20
35 5[PIN-963 TRACK LOADER 114-0358 $ 7.04 1% 3520 $ 2451 % 4.36
LESS 15%
36 4|RETAINER-TRACK LOADER 8E-6259 $ 4151 % 16.60
37 6|RETAINER-963 TRACK LOADER $ 1223 $ 7380 (% 43.79 | $ 131.37
6Y-0309 (REAR RIPPER)
38 5[PIN-963 TRACK LOADER 114-0358 NO BID $ 8.85|% 44.25
39 6|RETAINER-963 TRACK LOADER 114-0359 NO BID $ 8.00 | % 48.00
REAR RIPPER
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40 5|TOOTH CASE MOTOR GRADER NO BID $ 1532 | $ 76.60
75251673
41 5|ROLL PIN-CASE MOTOR GRADER NO BID $ 1410 | $ 70.50
75251674
$ 598.27 ($ 2,991.35
42 5|SHANK-CASE MOTOR GRADER 73162856 NO BID
43 6/TOOTH BULL DOZER (RIPPER) $ 9855 $ 591.30 | $ 52.02 [ $ 312.14
6Y-0352HX
LESS 15%
44 2|PIN-BULL DOZER (RIPPER) 9W2678 NO BID $ 216 | $ 4.32
45 2|TOOTH-BACKHOE TF-23D NO BID $ 9.08 | % 18.16
46 2|PIN-BACK HOES TF-23P NO BID $ 384 |$% 7.68
47 2|BLADE BOLT-MOTOR GRADER 3F-5108 | $ 170 | $ 340 (% 056 |$%$ 1.12
LESS 15%
48 2|BLADE NUT-MOTOR GRADER 4K-0367 $ 086 (9% 172 |$% 035($% 0.70
LESS 15%
49 1|BLADE WASHER-MOTOR GRADER $ 032($% 032($% 012 | $ 0.12
3B-4510
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LESS 15%
50 1|TOOTH 640359 $ 9855 $ 9855 $ 8758 % 87.58
LESS 15%
51 5[PIN 79309300 NO BID $ 9.78 | $ 48.90
52 4[TIP-AT166866 NO BID $ 599 | % 23.96
53 3|CUTTING EDGE-T187987 NO BID $ 150.00 | $ 450.00
54 3|END BIT-T187243 NO BID $ 130.00 | $ 390.00
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