Opened: August 18, 2009
Bud Numnber: 2010-14

COUNTY OF WEBB
Purchasing Department
BID TABULATION

BIDS FOR:

"Annual Contract for Janitorial Supplies”

Gulf Coast Paper
1101 S. Padre Dr.
Corpus Christi, Texas 78405

Patria Int'l Office Supply
301 E. Calton Rd.
Laredo, Texas 78041
956-723-2332 |

Ben E. Keith

5505 Kaepa Court
San Antonio, Texas

Primary Secondary
Alex Landin Mahthew Mcline
Miguel Trevino Sales Rep. Bid Coordinator
361-852-5252 956-220-8261 210-661-7997
ITEM| QTY ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL

1 |400cs |Amoco #31-583 3-compartment $16.30 $6,520 $15.96 $ 6,384.00| % 1798 | $ 7,190.91
foam plates or approved #95HTPF3 400 per/cs
"equal” (200 plates/case)500PCS (500 plates)
91/2X91/2X3

2 [100 cs [Round triple compartment $16.50 $1,650.00 $17.40 $ 1,740.00 | $ 21511 % 2,151.14
plastic coated plates TK10011 100 per/cs
(500 plates/case)

3 200 cs [#RCL-750 combo aluminum $53.40 $10,680.00 $55.35 $ 11,070.00 | $ 4855 $ 9,710.00
3-compartment plates or RCL750 200 per/cs
approved "equal”
(200 plates wi/lid/case)

4 |2cs Pint containers for hot soup No bid $36.96 $ 7392 | $ 53.20 | $ 106.40
#KH16A (not foam) w/lids
or approved "equal”
(250/16 oz/case)

5 300 cs [Foam cups, 6 0z. $15.00 $4,500 $15.22 $ 4,566.00 | $ 1367 | $ 4,101.00
(1000 cups/case) 6J6

6 |15cs Plastic cover lid for 60z cup $10.20 $153.00 $10.81 $ 162.15| $ 931 % 139.65
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Opened: August 18, 2009
Bud Numnber: 2010-14

COUNTY OF WEBB
Purchasing Department
BID TABULATION

BIDS FOR:

"Annual Contract for Janitorial Supplies”

Gulf Coast Paper
1101 S. Padre Dr.
Corpus Christi, Texas 78405

Patria Int'l Office Supply
301 E. Calton Rd.
Laredo, Texas 78041
956-723-2332 |

Ben E. Keith
5505 Kaepa Court
San Antonio, Texas

Primary Secondary
Alex Landin Mahthew Mcline
Miguel Trevino Sales Rep. Bid Coordinator
361-852-5252 956-220-8261 210-661-7997
ITEM| QTY ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL

(1000/case) 6JL

7 |50cs Foam cups, 8 oz. $17.00 $880.00 $17.17 858.50 | $ 16.01| $ 800.50
(1000 cups/case) #8J8

8 |50cs Foam cups, 10 oz. $22.40 $1,120.00 $20.85 1,04250  $ 20.39 [ $ 1,019.50
(1000 cups/case) 10J10

9 |300cs [Medium weight plastic $8.60 $2,580.00 $8.00 2,400.00 | $ 1190 $ 3,570.00
Spoons (1000 spoons/cs) #WMS

10 [25¢cs Medium weight plastic forks $8.60 $215.00 $8.00 200.00 | $ 1190 $ 297.50
(1000 forks/case) #WMF

11 [25¢cs Medium weight plastic knives $8.60 $215.00 $8.00 200.00 | $ 1190 $ 297.50
(1000 knives/case) #WMK

12 200 cs |Heavy weight, white 58-gal $19.60 $3,920.00 $19.90 3,980.00 | $ 54751 $ 10,950.00
min. 17 micron, 386016W 200 200 per/cs
trash can liners, 36 x 60" 200PER/CS
Quantity/case:

13 [124 cs |Heavy duty, white 45-gal $20.60 $2,554.40 $17.77 2,203.48 | $ 1599 $ 1,982.76
min. 17 micron, trash can 404816W 250 4/25ct per/cs
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Opened: August 18, 2009
Bud Numnber: 2010-14

COUNTY OF WEBB
Purchasing Department
BID TABULATION

BIDS FOR:

"Annual Contract for Janitorial Supplies”

Gulf Coast Paper
1101 S. Padre Dr.
Corpus Christi, Texas 78405

Patria Int'l Office Supply
301 E. Calton Rd.
Laredo, Texas 78041
956-723-2332 |

Ben E. Keith
5505 Kaepa Court
San Antonio, Texas

Primary Secondary
Alex Landin Mahthew Mcline
Miguel Trevino Sales Rep. Bid Coordinator
361-852-5252 956-220-8261 210-661-7997
ITEM| QTY ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
liners, 40 x 48" 250/cs
Quantity/case
14 |124 cs |Trash can liners, 35-gal $14.60 $1,810.40 $16.30 $ 202120 % 2236 $ 2,772.64
16 microns, 33 x 40" 334016 250 6/25ct per/cs
Quantity/case; 250/cs
15 |100 cs |Trash can liners, 8-gal $14.00 $1,400.00 $16.05 $ 1,605.00]| $ 4476 | $ 4,476.00
6 microns, 24 x 32" 24338 1/1000 ct per/cs
1000/cs
16 |544 cs |Toilet tissue rolls, 2-ply $31.90 $17,353.60 $29.41 $ 1599.04| % 58.47 | $ 31,807.68
500 sheets (96 rolls/case) GP19880 80/450 ct per/cs
80 ROLLS
17 |25¢cs  |White single fold paper towel $22.00 $550.00 $17.74 $ 44350 | $ 2557 | $ 639.25
Quantity/case: 4M/CS GP20904 4000 16/250ct per/cs
$14.50 $3,523.50 $16.57 $ 4,00651|% 2557 % 6,213.21
18 |243 cs |Brown single or multi-fold 4M/CS GP23304 4000 16/250ct per/cs
paper towels
Quantity/case:
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Opened: August 18, 2009
Bud Numnber: 2010-14

COUNTY OF WEBB
Purchasing Department
BID TABULATION

BIDS FOR: Patria Int'l Office Supply
Gulf Coast Paper 301 E. Calton Rd. Ben E. Keith
1101 S. Padre Dr. Laredo, Texas 78041 5505 Kaepa Court
"Annual Contract for Janitorial Supplies” Corpus Christi, Texas 78405 |956-723-2332 | San Antonio, Texas
Primary Secondary
Alex Landin Mahthew Mcline
Miguel Trevino Sales Rep. Bid Coordinator
361-852-5252 956-220-8261 210-661-7997
ITEM| QTY ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
19 |25¢cs  |Wypall cleaning towels, $ 33.00 $825.00 $42.10 $ 1,05250( $ 3955 | $ 988.75
12 x 15", white wiper, non- K5812 KCE-05812 1/150ct per/cs
abrasive or approved "equal” 12pk of 90 1080
Quantity/case: 12pkg/90/cs
.39/EA
20 |25¢cs Handi-Wipes No bid No bid $20.60 $ 515.00 | $ 2386 | $ 596.50
Quantity/case: 200 12/80 ct per/cs
CHI-8507
$ 2773 | $ 2,301.59
21 (83 cs Brown hand towel rolls $15.60 $ 1,294.80 $20.41 $ 1,694.03 (12/350ct per/cs
for dispenser #RK350A 6RL/800
size 1 7/8" Core 12PKOF350 #2790
Quantity/case:
22 (35¢cs Kitchen paper roll towels $ 20.90 $731.50 $20.92 $ 73220 | $ 3352 % 1,173.20
9x11", 2-ply, white, poly-wrapped #GP27300 PNL-8272 30/100ct per cs
Towel/roll: 100sh/re 85
Quantity/Case: 30 ROLLS 30
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Opened: August 18, 2009
Bud Numnber: 2010-14

COUNTY OF WEBB
Purchasing Department
BID TABULATION

BIDS FOR:

"Annual Contract for Janitorial Supplies”

Gulf Coast Paper
1101 S. Padre Dr.
Corpus Christi, Texas 78405

Patria Int'l Office Supply
301 E. Calton Rd.
Laredo, Texas 78041
956-723-2332 |

Ben E. Keith
5505 Kaepa Court
San Antonio, Texas

Primary Secondary
Alex Landin Mahthew Mcline
Miguel Trevino Sales Rep. Bid Coordinator
361-852-5252 956-220-8261 210-661-7997
ITEM| QTY ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
23 [5¢s White embossed paper napkins $ 31.60 $153.00 $33.99 $ 169.95 | $ 47.05| $ 235.25
13 x 13" or approved "equal” #D820 #3796 8/500ct per cs
6m/cs 6000
24 [10cs Multi-fold white paper towel $ 17.40 $174.00 $17.74 $ 17740 | $ 27.16 | $ 271.60
Quantity/case: #MB540A 4000 16/250 ct per cs
6m/cs
25 |10 box |Thrifty napkins No bid No bid $30.70 $ 307.00 | $ 60.97 | $ 609.70
Quantity/box: 10,000 24/250 ct per cs
26 [35ea |Rayon mopheads, 24 oz. $ 4.30 $150.50 $3.11 $ 108.85| $ 1502 $ 525.70
#24RCL 3/each
240z
27 |90 ea |Cotton mopheads, 24 oz. $ 3.10 $279.50 $2.77 $ 249.30 | $ 1098 $ 988.20
24CCL 3/each
28 |35ea Cotton mopheads, 16 oz. $ 2.20 $77.00 $1.89 $ 66.15 | $ 343 % 120.05
16CCL 1/100z
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Opened: August 18, 2009
Bud Numnber: 2010-14

COUNTY OF WEBB
Purchasing Department
BID TABULATION

BIDS FOR:

"Annual Contract for Janitorial Supplies”

Gulf Coast Paper
1101 S. Padre Dr.
Corpus Christi, Texas 78405

Patria Int'l Office Supply
301 E. Calton Rd.
Laredo, Texas 78041
956-723-2332 |

Ben E. Keith

5505 Kaepa Court

San Antonio, Texas

Primary Secondary
Alex Landin Mahthew Mcline
Miguel Trevino Sales Rep. Bid Coordinator
361-852-5252 956-220-8261 210-661-7997
ITEM| QTY ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
29 |[25ea |Fiberglass mop handles, 60" $ 8.60 $215.00 $10.55 $ 263.75 | $ 280 | $ 70.00
60" 60CL doz
30 |15doz [Household brooms, 28#, 6 sewn $60.26 $903.90 $52.20 $ 783.00 | $ 60.14 | $ 902.10
JANBR IMP-94 doz
31 |15doz |Wood Janitor Handle $ 33.60 $504.00 $65.52 $ 937.80 | $ 3136 $ 470.40
dozen UNS-603 doz
#125
32 |15doz [|Warehouse brooms, 36 Ib $ 9840 $ 1,476.00 $76.60 $ 1,149.00 | $ 12409 |$ 1,861.36
WHSEBR doz
33 |20 ea |Push brooms, Heavy duty, $ 9.60 $192.00 $11.70 $ 234.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 200.00
16" w/handle, street type #1616/136 BRU7116 1/18in each
BRU125
34 [3doz |Rubbermaid dust pans or $ 2.30 $82.80 $41.20 $ 136.20 | $ 13.07 | $ 39.21
approved "equal” 36/ea RCP-200SCHA doz
#2005 dozen
35 |20 ea |Dust mopheads, 5x30" $ 6.60 $132.00 $7.54 $ 158.80 | $ 3641 % 72.80
#536DM# UNS-1330 each
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Opened: August 18, 2009
Bud Numnber: 2010-14

COUNTY OF WEBB
Purchasing Department
BID TABULATION

BIDS FOR:

"Annual Contract for Janitorial Supplies”

Gulf Coast Paper
1101 S. Padre Dr.
Corpus Christi, Texas 78405

Patria Int'l Office Supply
301 E. Calton Rd.
Laredo, Texas 78041

956-723-2332

Ben E. Keith
5505 Kaepa Court
San Antonio, Texas

Primary Secondary
Alex Landin Mahthew Mcline
Miguel Trevino Sales Rep. Bid Coordinator
361-852-5252 956-220-8261 210-661-7997
ITEM| QTY ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
36 |15ea |Feather duster ostrich $ 5.00 $75.00 $4.77 $ 7155 | $ 9.99| $ 149.85
feather on plastic handle 15" 5263 TXF-12DC 1/each
37 |15ea |Plastic bucket w/caster, $ 35.00 $525.00 $52.94 $ 56.82 [ $ 852.30
26 quart capacity 7570 Combo each
Unit less Combo #38
than w/mop wringer
Single
38 [5ea Separate plastic mop wringer $ 48.20 $241.00
24 oz. #6127
(Item 37 & $ 5114 $ 255.70
38 combined 1/32 0z each
Combo w/bucket wringer #7580 $ 50.50 | $ 50.50 | to (1) price)
39 [5ea Floor squeegee 18" w/handle $ 13.40 $67.00 $9.78 $ 48.90 | $ 1549 | $ 77.45
or approved "equal” #1800/125 UNG-FP45 each
BRU 125
40 |35¢cs Liquid hand soap (gal.) $ 25.00 $875.00 $14.10 $ 493.50 $42.34 $ 1,481.90
Hypoallengenic Pure Natural LIQANOCLN2 4 gals. 4/1gal
or Equal 4/1 gl. gal.
Quantity/case:
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Opened: August 18, 2009
Bud Numnber: 2010-14

COUNTY OF WEBB
Purchasing Department
BID TABULATION

BIDS FOR:

"Annual Contract for Janitorial Supplies”

Gulf Coast Paper
1101 S. Padre Dr.
Corpus Christi, Texas 78405

Patria Int'l Office Supply
301 E. Calton Rd.
Laredo, Texas 78041
956-723-2332 |

Ben E. Keith
5505 Kaepa Court
San Antonio, Texas

Primary Secondary
Alex Landin Mahthew Mcline
Miguel Trevino Sales Rep. Bid Coordinator
361-852-5252 956-220-8261 210-661-7997
ITEM| QTY ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
41 |25¢cs Zest or Dial, bar soap, $ 55.00 | $1,375.00 $62.45 $ 1561.25| % 6553 $ 1,638.25
wrapped, 1.5 oz 1-Dial D1A-00194 500/1.50z
NO SUBSTITUTES 500/cs 12/800ML Cs
Quantity/case: 500/per cs Dail
42 |15¢c Liquid hand soap/dispenser $ 40.10 $601.50 $27.17 $ 407.55 $38.47 $ 577.05
Quantity/case: TODAY DES8100 12/2.50z
12/800ML 12/800ML
43 |20ea Toilet bowl brushes, long $ 1.90 $38.00 $2.10 $ 4200 | $ 330 % 66.00
4533 RCP-6310WH1 each
44 |2doz |Plunger, long handle $ 7.00 $168.00 $38.40 $ 76.80 | $ 348 | $ 83.52
24 ea. UNS-9201
#520 Dozen
$5.89 ea
45 |30ea |Sparta Hercules #45-S pot & $ 3.40 $102.00 $3.40 $ 102.00 | $ 8221 % 246.60
fender brush or approved "equal” 4343 BRU-4308 1/20in
46 |10cs  |Scrubbing sponges 3m #74 $ 33.00 $330.00 $39.60 $ 396.00 $6.16 $ 61.60
3-1/2-6-1/4" pr approved 74 3M-74 1/20ct
equal 20/cs 20/cs
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Opened: August 18, 2009
Bud Numnber: 2010-14

COUNTY OF WEBB
Purchasing Department
BID TABULATION

BIDS FOR:

"Annual Contract for Janitorial Supplies”

Gulf Coast Paper
1101 S. Padre Dr.

Corpus Christi, Texas 78405

Patria Int'l Office Supply
301 E. Calton Rd.
Laredo, Texas 78041
956-723-2332 |

Ben E. Keith
5505 Kaepa Court
San Antonio, Texas

Primary Secondary
Alex Landin Mahthew Mcline
Miguel Trevino Sales Rep. Bid Coordinator
361-852-5252 956-220-8261 210-661-7997
ITEM| QTY ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
Quanitity/case: $17.25 $ 17.50
174 PAD
20/cs
47 (10 ea |Square handle brushes, med. $ 3.40 $34.00 $3.36 $ 33.60 $2.95 $ 29.50
hard bristles for cleaning 4343 #5308
counters
48 |5box |Heavy duty scouring pads $ 30.95 $154.50 $37.95 $ 189.75 $6.16 $ 30.80
3M #88, 3-1/2x5" 88 3M-88 3/12cs
Quantity/box: 4bx/10=40cs 40/cs
$13.05 $ 62.25
PAD-188
20/cs
49 100 drurLaundry detergent (100#/drum) $ 94.50 $94.50 $50.27 $ 5,027.00 $71.91 $ 7,191.00
ALTAIDO 1/5gal
N/S
50 |30cs LD-33 liquid dishwasing $ 43.40 [ $1,302.00 $23.50 $ 705.00 $47.90 $ 1,437.00
detergent (NO SUBSTITUTES) LD331 4/1gal
51 |60 cs Bleach 5% chlorine $ 10.60 $636.00 $9.98 $ 598.80 $10.40 $ 624.00
(6 gals/case) 6BLCH 6/960z
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Opened: August 18, 2009
Bud Numnber: 2010-14

COUNTY OF WEBB

Purchasing

Department

BID TABULATION

BIDS FOR:

Gulf Coast Paper

Patria Int'l Offi

ce Supply

301 E. Calton Rd.

Ben E. Keith

1101 S. Padre Dr. Laredo, Texas 78041 5505 Kaepa Court
"Annual Contract for Janitorial Supplies” Corpus Christi, Texas 78405 |956-723-2332 San Antonio, Texas
Primary Secondary
Alex Landin Mahthew Mcline
Miguel Trevino Sales Rep. Bid Coordinator
361-852-5252 956-220-8261 210-661-7997
ITEM| QTY ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
52 |10 drum |Pink powder dishwashing $ 120.00 | $1,200.00 $ 79.67 | $ 796.70 $38.06 $ 380.60
soap (100#/drum) pinksuds 100 #50 50 Ib/ctn 1/5gal
53 [5¢s Floor spraybuff High Speed $ 44.50 $222.50 $26.10 $ 130.50 $27.84 $ 139.20
(5 gal. container/case) PSPRYBUFF N/S RENUE 128/20z
54 |20 cs Floor stripper rinse free $ 29.60 $592.00 $26.17 $ 523.40 $18.89 $ 377.80
( 1gal. Container) RINSEFREE1 1/gal
per gal
Hvy Dty
Cot p/gal 1.10
10 to 1 dilution
Cost p/gal
when mixed
1to gal.
55 [60 gal |Johnson's complete floor $ 46.70 $560.40 $10.40 $ 624.00 $17.70 $ 1,062.00
wax or approved "equal” COMP5 TOPSHINE 1/gal
(5 gal/container) $42.22
5gal/pail
56 |5cs 13", 17", 20" Floor pads $ 6.90 | $ 3450 | $ 1240 | $ 62.00 $16.99 $ 84.95
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Opened: August 18, 2009
Bud Numnber: 2010-14

COUNTY OF WEBB
Purchasing Department
BID TABULATION

BIDS FOR:

Gulf Coast Paper

Patria Int'l Office Supply
301 E. Calton Rd.

Ben E. Keith

1101 S. Padre Dr. Laredo, Texas 78041 5505 Kaepa Court
"Annual Contract for Janitorial Supplies” Corpus Christi, Texas 78405 |956-723-2332 San Antonio, Texas
Primary Secondary
Alex Landin Mahthew Mcline
Miguel Trevino Sales Rep. Bid Coordinator
361-852-5252 956-220-8261 210-661-7997
ITEM| QTY ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
for high speed (5 pads/case) 13" 13"
$ 10.20 | $ 51.00 | $ 1845 $ 92.25 $16.99 $ 84.95
17" 17"
$ 1320 | $ 66.00 | $ 1722 | $ 86.10 $18.49 $ 92.49
20" 20"
57 |20 cs Thrifty Pine, Cherry or Mint $ 28.40 $568.00 $20.40 $ 408.00 $31.23 $ 624.60
disinfectant APA register PINE1 4 gal/Pine 4/1gal
5% active ingredients 4/1 gl. $ 2422 | $ 484.40
Quantity/case: 4 gal/mint
58 |30 drum |Pine Cleaner/disinfectant APA $ 381.30 | $11,439.00 $177.00 $ 5,310.00 $31.23 $ 936.90
Register min 5% (55 gal drum) PINES55 N/S 4/1gal
59 [20cs  |All purpose cleaner or approved $ 24.10 $482.00 $24.32 $ 486.40 $26.15 $ 523.00
equal proportioner 4gallcs 4 gallcs 4/1gal
(6 gals/case) #sd201 #3645
lemon scent
60 |60 cs Comet or Ajax power $ 22.10 | $1,326.00 $19.77 $ 1,186.20 $21.32 $ 1,279.20
or approved "equal” BLJAX CPC-14278 24/210z
24/210z 24/210z
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Opened: August 18, 2009
Bud Numnber: 2010-14

COUNTY OF WEBB
Purchasing Department
BID TABULATION

BIDS FOR:

"Annual Contract for Janitorial Supplies”

Gulf Coast Paper
1101 S. Padre Dr.
Corpus Christi, Texas 78405

Patria Int'l Office Supply
301 E. Calton Rd.
Laredo, Texas 78041
956-723-2332 |

Ben E. Keith

5505 Kaepa Court
San Antonio, Texas

Primary Secondary
Alex Landin Mahthew Mcline
Miguel Trevino Sales Rep. Bid Coordinator
361-852-5252 956-220-8261 210-661-7997
ITEM| QTY ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
61 [15cs Mr. Muscle oven cleaner or $ 36.50 $547.50 $36.17 $ 542.55 $24.36 365.40
approved "equal” OVENAERO #2060 6/200z
Quantity/case: 12/180z 12-190z
62 [5cs Foam type carpet cleaner $ 35.40 $177.00 $36.22 $ 181.10 | $ 57.44 287.20
Quantity/case: CARPSTRMV AMR-A169-20 4/1gal
12/180z Misty Green
12/190z
63 [12cs |Glass cleaner (gal.) $ 29.00 $348.00 $13.90 $ 166.80 | $ 16.64 199.68
concentrated SCWC1 4 gal. 4/1gal
Quantity/case: 4/1 gl.
64 [12cs |Glass Cleaner foam spray $ 23.20 $278.40 $23.67 $ 284.04 | $ 23.00 292.32
Quantity/case: 12/180z SYS-2020 12
12/200z
65 [20cs  |Air freshner spray $ 27.20 $544.00 $36.98 $ 739.60 | $ 38.65 773.00
Quantity/case: 12/160z AMR-AZ38-20 1/kit
Lemon Peel
Snappy Apple
Spring Rain
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Opened: August 18, 2009
Bud Numnber: 2010-14

COUNTY OF WEBB
Purchasing Department
BID TABULATION

BIDS

FOR:

"Annual Contract for Janitorial Supplies”

Gulf Coast Paper

1101 S. Padre Dr.
Corpus Christi, Texas 78405

Patria Int'l Office Supply
301 E. Calton Rd.
Laredo, Texas 78041
956-723-2332 |

Ben E. Keith

5505 Kaepa Court
San Antonio, Texas

Primary Secondary
Alex Landin Mahthew Mcline
Miguel Trevino Sales Rep. Bid Coordinator
361-852-5252 956-220-8261 210-661-7997
ITEM| QTY ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
66 [10cs Insect spray killer $ 35.30 $353.00 $55.05 $ 550.50 | $ 5553 | $ 555.30
Quantity/case: #F6 AERO 4/320z
12/170z 12/200z
67 |5cs Air 60 foul order eliminator $ 23.70 $118.50 $34.78 $ 17390 | $ 1651 | $ 82.55
or approved "equal” AIRSMOKE1 #3674 4/160z
4/1 gl. Eliminate Il
68 [10cs Powder rug & room deodorizer $ 34.10 $341.00 $27.05 $ 27050 | $ 4432 | $ 443.20
SAMPLE REQUIRED carpetfresh 12/160z 6/320z
Quantity/case: 12/200z lemon per box
mint
apple
69 |10 cs Deodorant blocks, 4 oz.with $ 92.40 $924.00 $7.40 $ 74.00 | $ 1161 $ 116.10
hangers (12/case) 12dz/cs KRY-B04 1/12ct
BOWLBLOCK
70 |10cs Raid Roach & Ant killer or $ 53.20 $532.00 $55.05 $ 550.50 | $ 43.08 | $ 430.80
iplicated) approved "equal” ROACH DRK-94400 6/190z
Quantity/case: 12/150z RAID
12/19.50z
71 |5¢s Cherry or lemon air freshner $ 16.80 $84.00 $18.52 $ 9260 | $ 38.65| $ 193.25
Liquid deodorant wick type BIGNEUT AE4593205A 1/kit
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Opened: August 18, 2009

Bud Numnber: 2010-14

COUNTY OF WEBB
Purchasing Department
BID TABULATION

BIDS FOR:

"Annual Contract for Janitorial Supplies”

Gulf Coast Paper
1101 S. Padre Dr.
Corpus Christi, Texas 78405

Patria Int'l Office Supply

301 E. Calton Rd.

Laredo, Texas 78041

956-723-2332

Ben E. Keith

5505 Kaepa Court
San Antonio, Texas

Primary Secondary
Alex Landin Mahthew Mcline
Miguel Trevino Sales Rep. Bid Coordinator
361-852-5252 956-220-8261 210-661-7997
ITEM| QTY ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
Quantity/cas: 12 per/cs Vanilla scent
12/per case
72 |5¢s Stoves grease, oven & grill cleaner | $ 32.50 $162.50 $24.50 $ 12250 | $ 33.91 169.55
Quantity/case: OVEN1 #3680 4-1gal
4/1 gl. 4 gals
73 |5¢s Stoves grease, oven & grill cleaner | $ 36.50 $182.50 $36.17 $ 180.85| $ 38.60 193.00
spray OVENAERO SYS-2060 12/320z
Quantity/case: 12/180z 12/190z
74 |10 cs Foam disinfectant cleaner $ 25.40 $254.00 $29.11 $ 291.10 | $ 24.36 243.60
Quantity/case: TNT NCL-Rely 2003 6/200z
12/180z 12/190z
75 [5¢s Enbac spray disinfectant $ 51.30 $256.50 $41.92 $ 209.60 | $ 47.88 239.00
Quantity/case: ENDBAC?2 CLOROX DISINF 12/160z
12/150z SPRAY
EPA Register
CLO-38504
12/190z
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Opened: August 18, 2009
Bud Numnber: 2010-14

COUNTY OF WEBB
Purchasing Department
BID TABULATION

BIDS FOR:

Gulf Coast Paper

Patria Int'l Office Supply
301 E. Calton Rd.

Ben E. Keith

1101 S. Padre Dr. Laredo, Texas 78041 5505 Kaepa Court
"Annual Contract for Janitorial Supplies” Corpus Christi, Texas 78405 |956-723-2332 San Antonio, Texas
Primary Secondary
Alex Landin Mahthew Mcline
Miguel Trevino Sales Rep. Bid Coordinator
361-852-5252 956-220-8261 210-661-7997
ITEM| QTY ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
76 [20cs  |Carroll Thick porcelain & bowl $ 17.80 $356.00 $24.10 $ 482.00 | $ 1890 ( $ 378.00
cleaner or approved "equal” SPARCLING 12/320z 6/1ct
Quantity/case: 12/320z Bathroom
Plus
77 |10 cont |Industrial grade foam cleaner $ 25.40 $254.00 $28.80 $ 288.00 | $ 94.18 | $ 941.80
wi/disinfection for stainless steel TNT Pronto TB 1/2.5¢gal
commodes (quart spray) 12/180z 13/320z
Quantity/case:
78 |10 cs Kleenex #21600 48/150 $ 39.90 $399.00 $51.03 $ 510.30 | $ 2534 $ 253.40
K21606 KCC 21400
5/13 $ 18.98
Facial Tissue
79 [8cs Liquid extraction cleaner w/built $ 31.03 $248.24 $40.88 $ 327.04 | $ 3239 | $ 259.12
in anti-foam (6 gal/case 4 gal-cs) CONSTAT1 EDGE-PLUS 6/240z
Quantity/case: 4/1 gl. 4 gals.
80 [7cs Spray wood panel cleaner $ 28.20 $197.40 $34.63 $ 242.41 | $ 40.86 | $ 286.02
SAMPLE REQUIRED PWOODAERO #2030 12/12.50z
Quantity/case: 12/160z 12/200z
81 [7CS Drano pipe drain opener $ 21.60 $151.20 $33.65 $ 23555 | $ 43.74 | $ 306.18
or approved "equal” BLOCAID R993-12 12/320z
Quantity/case: Halt Drain
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Opened: August 18, 2009
Bud Numnber: 2010-14

COUNTY OF WEBB
Purchasing Department
BID TABULATION

BIDS FOR:

"Annual Contract for Janitorial Supplies”

Gulf Coast Paper

1101 S. Padre Dr.

Corpus Christi, Texas 78405

Patria Int'l Office Supply
301 E. Calton Rd.
Laredo, Texas 78041
956-723-2332 |

Ben E. Keith

5505 Kaepa Court
San Antonio, Texas

Primary Secondary
Alex Landin Mahthew Mcline
Miguel Trevino Sales Rep. Bid Coordinator
361-852-5252 956-220-8261 210-661-7997
ITEM| QTY ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
Opener
12/320z
82 [10cs  |Spray furniture polish for wood $ 27.20 $272.00 $34.63 $ 346.30 | $ 40.86 | $ 408.60
SAMPLE REQUIRED CITRO SYS-2030 12/12.50z
Quantity/case: 12/180z 12/200z
83 [2¢cs Chewing gum remover $ 37.80 $75.60 $31.15 $ 62.30 | $ 50.24 | $ 100.48
Quantity/case: JGUM SYS-2090 1/12ct
12/5.30z 12
84 (6dz Urinal screen disposable $ 19.30 $115.80 $ 8.05($% 4830 | $ 48.30 | $ 698.18
urinal maint. Super Uni-tabs URINALSEN KRY-1001, 1002 6/12ct
or approved "equal” $ 12.00 12
Quanitty/case: Bubble gum/
Cherry scent
85 [10cs Plastic gloves med. Size 18% $ 33.30 $333.00 $7.82 $ 7820 | $ 2388 | $ 238.80
synthetic bayprene latex & 69210M GLX-242 4/100ct
nat. latex.020 thickness,Granet 10bx of 100 SMALL, MED per case
#2444 or orange Playtex #834 LARGE,XL
Quantity/case: 12
$ 2388 (% 597.00
86 [25cs Disposable plastic gloves $ 17.30 $432.50 $ 9.36 | $ 234.00 4/100ct
Quantity/case: 10/100 #370L
#10418 1000
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Opened: August 18, 2009
Bud Numnber: 2010-14

COUNTY OF WEBB
Purchasing Department
BID TABULATION

BIDS FOR:

"Annual Contract for Janitorial Supplies”

Gulf Coast Paper
1101 S. Padre Dr.

Corpus Christi, Texas 78405

Patria Int'l Office Supply
301 E. Calton Rd.
Laredo, Texas 78041
956-723-2332 |

Ben E. Keith

5505 Kaepa Court
San Antonio, Texas

Primary Secondary
Alex Landin Mahthew Mcline
Miguel Trevino Sales Rep. Bid Coordinator
361-852-5252 956-220-8261 210-661-7997
ITEM| QTY ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL

87 |20 ¢cs White, plastic disposable $ 40.00 $800.00 $9.89 234.00 | $ 39.75| % 795.00
aprons, USDA #10418 GLX 390 1/100ct
Quantity/case: 5/100 100

88 [10roll [Disposable, re-usable poly No bid No bid $ 13.00 130.00 $43.69 $ 436.90
table shirt, 29"x14' untsta2914 100each

89 [5¢s Med. Weight mesh hair nets $ 152.30 $761.50 $18.97 9485 | $ 1949 | $ 97.45
(144/case) HN500 #1255 1/144ct

90 [10cs |C.L.-44 wasp spray or approved $ 37.10 $371.00 $58.05 580.50 | $ 43.08 | $ 430.80
"equal" WASP TMS-3653 6/190z
Quantity/case: 12/170z 12/200z

91 |10cs |Stainless steel cleaner $ 37.80 $378.00 $35.02 350.20 | $ 3050 | $ 305.00
12/160z SPARSTEEL SYS-2040 6/160z
Quantity/case: 12/160z 12/190z

92 92(Dust mop treatment (gal.) $ 22.40 $107.50 $62.17 310.85 | $ 27441 $ 137.20
Quantity/case: DUSTMOP1 AMR-R811-4 100/1/2 cup

4/1 gl. 4 gal.
93 |20 ea |Plastic bottle32 oz. $ 0.30 $6.00 $0.56 1120 | $ 9221 % 184.40
BOTTLEQT UNS-32 1/6ct
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Opened: August 18, 2009
Bud Numnber: 2010-14

COUNTY OF WEBB
Purchasing Department
BID TABULATION

BIDS FOR:

"Annual Contract for Janitorial Supplies”

Gulf Coast Paper
1101 S. Padre Dr.
Corpus Christi, Texas 78405

Patria Int'l Office Supply
301 E. Calton Rd.
Laredo, Texas 78041
956-723-2332 |

Ben E. Keith

5505 Kaepa Court
San Antonio, Texas

Primary Secondary
Alex Landin Mahthew Mcline
Miguel Trevino Sales Rep. Bid Coordinator
361-852-5252 956-220-8261 210-661-7997
ITEM| QTY ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
93A |20ea Plastic Trigger sprayer 32 oz $ 0.03 $6.00 $0.65 $ 13.00 | $ 9221 % 184.40
TRIGQT UNS-922-9 1/6ct
94 |15cs Plastic sandwich bags 7"x6-1/2", $ 41.30 $619.50 $ 1645 $ 246.75 | $ 3524 % 528.60
Fold'n close W-F7 (1000/case) #625 WAX OPEN 1/2000ct
(2000/cs) TOP/SIDE
BGC421
(8000)
$15.08
(1000)
95 |20 roll |Heavy duty aluminum foil paper $ 62.70 | $1,254.00 $ 5470 [ $ 1,094.00 | $ 5083 $ 1,196.60
#625, 18"x1000 ft. or approved 625 BWK-7106 L/roll
"equal”
96 |10cs Pan liners, 16-3/8 x 24-3/8 $ 32.70 $327.00 $ 3997 % 399.70 | $ 43.86 | $ 438.60
LO10 MCD-5107 1/100ct
1M/S 1000
97 [10¢cs P.O. 75S medication plastic cups, No bid No bid $ 3074 | $ 307.40| $ 120.88( $ 1,208.80
3/4 oz. or approved "equal” 5000
Quantity/case:
98 [10cs  |#39 medication paper souffle $ 37.30 $373.00 $ 3495 | $ 34950 | $ 3564 | $ 356.40
cups, 3/4 oz. or approved "equal” 39S0uU 20/250ct
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Opened: August 18, 2009
Bud Numnber: 2010-14

COUNTY OF WEBB
Purchasing Department
BID TABULATION

BIDS FOR:

"Annual Contract for Janitorial Supplies”

Gulf Coast Paper
1101 S. Padre Dr.
Corpus Christi, Texas 78405

Patria Int'l Office Supply
301 E. Calton Rd.
Laredo, Texas 78041
956-723-2332 |

Ben E. Keith
5505 Kaepa Court
San Antonio, Texas

Primary Secondary
Alex Landin Mahthew Mcline
Miguel Trevino Sales Rep. Bid Coordinator
361-852-5252 956-220-8261 210-661-7997
ITEM| QTY ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
Quantity/case: 5M/S
99 [50cs Sanitary napkins, regular $ 28.10 | $1,405.00 $40.36 $ 201800 $ 56.73| $ 2,836.50
size, individually wrapped 147 GARD HOS-48054 4/box
Quantity/case: 250/S 250
100 |20 cs |5 gal. Container custom car wash | $ 36.10 $722.00 $39.24 $ 784.80 | $ 41.02 | $ 820.40
CUSTOM5 5 gal 4/1gal
101 (2 cs Grill brick 8x4x3 1/2 $ 18.30 $36.60 $20.63 $ 4126 | $ 4126 | $ 31.50
Quantity/case: 12/cs 3M-19192 1/12ct
GBRICK INSTITUTIONAL
12
102 |72 cs Toilet Tissue Jumbo 2000'x3.96 $ 19.10 | $1,375.20 $25.63 $ 184536 | $ 3182 $ 2,289.60
1/4 dia. 2 ply. 3.3" Core 8/cs BWK-6102 1/8ct
Quantity/case: #GP13718 6 rolls
1/PLY
102.A/72cs Toilet Tissue Jumbo $ 17.10 | $1,231.20 $18.90 $ 1,360.80| $ 5349 $ 3,851.21
1000'X3.96 1/4 GP12798 12 rolls 1/12ct
2ply. 3.3" Core 12/CS
Quantity/case:
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Opened: August 18, 2009
Bud Numnber: 2010-14

COUNTY OF WEBB
Purchasing Department
BID TABULATION

BIDS FOR:

"Annual Contract for Janitorial Supplies”

Gulf Coast Paper
1101 S. Padre Dr.
Corpus Christi, Texas 78405

Patria Int'l Office Supply
301 E. Calton Rd.
Laredo, Texas 78041
956-723-2332 |

Ben E. Keith
5505 Kaepa Court
San Antonio, Texas

Primary Secondary
Alex Landin Mahthew Mcline
Miguel Trevino Sales Rep. Bid Coordinator
361-852-5252 956-220-8261 210-661-7997
ITEM| QTY ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
103 |10 cs  [Wax Bags for Sanitary Napkin $ 11.10 $111.00 $23.17 $ 231.70 | $ 1943 $ 194.30
receptable Rubbermaid 6141 HS6141 HOS6141 1/250ct
or Equal 250/SC 250
Quantity/case:
104 |48 ea  [Neoprene Flocklined Gloves No bid No bid $9.27 $ 44496 | $ 5341 % 256.32
chemical resistant ea. Pair 10/100ct
Quantity/case: EA
105 |24 ea  |Neoprene Apron No bid No bid No bid No bid $ 39.75 | $ 954.00
19 Mil thickness Medium 1/100ct
Weight
Quantity/case:
106 (35 ea |Dust Mopheads $ 4.80 $168.00 $6.47 $ 22645 | $ 409 $ 143.15
5x24 524DMH UNS-1324 ea
Quantity/case: 12/CS each
107 (35 ea  |Dust mopheads 5 x 48 $ 12.10 $423.50 $11.69 $ 409.15  $ 5231 % 183.05
Quantity/case; 548DMH UNS1348 ea
12/CS each
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Opened: August 18, 2009
Bud Numnber: 2010-14

COUNTY OF WEBB
Purchasing Department
BID TABULATION

BIDS FOR:

"Annual Contract for Janitorial Supplies”

Gulf Coast Paper
1101 S. Padre Dr.
Corpus Christi, Texas 78405

Patria Int'l Office Supply

301 E. Calton Rd.

Laredo, Texas 78041

956-723-2332

Ben E. Keith

5505 Kaepa Court
San Antonio, Texas

Primary Secondary
Alex Landin Mahthew Mcline
Miguel Trevino Sales Rep. Bid Coordinator
361-852-5252 956-220-8261 210-661-7997
ITEM| QTY ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
108 |20 ea  [Dust Mopheads frames clip-on $ 1.80 $36.00 $2.56 51.20 | $ 364 (3% 72.80
5x24 5240DMF UNS1424 ea
Quantity/case: ea 12per/cs each
109 |20 ea  |Dust Mopheads frames clip-on $ 3.50 $70.00 $4.18 83.60 | $ 6.25| $ 125.00
5x48 548DMF UNS-1448 each ea
Quantity/case: 12/CS
110 (40 ea |Tiolet Bowl mop $ 0.50 $20.00 $0.73 29.20 | $ 330 % 132.00
guantity/case: BMOP UNS-160 ea
each each
111 |20 ea [Floor folding sign $ 9.10 $182.00 $12.25 245.00 $8.75 $ 175.00
Two-sided Caution Wet Floor 611277 RCP-6112 YEL ea
112 |40 ea [Plastic Bottle and trigger $ 0.60 $24.00 $1.25 50.00 | $ 1056 | $ 422.40
sprayer 2402 BOTTLEQT/ each 4/ea
Quantity/case: TRIGGT
each
ITEMS 113 THRU 128 MUST BE SPARTAN OR EQUAL APPROVED
113 |10 gal [Shineline emulsifier plus $ 8.80 $88.00 $9.58 95.80 | Special Order | Special Order
stripper or approval equal SHINEEP1 suprer surge
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Opened: August 18, 2009
Bud Numnber: 2010-14

COUNTY OF WEBB
Purchasing Department
BID TABULATION

BIDS FOR:

"Annual Contract for Janitorial Supplies”

Gulf Coast Paper
1101 S. Padre Dr.

Corpus Christi, Texas 78405

Patria Int'l Office Supply
301 E. Calton Rd.
Laredo, Texas 78041
956-723-2332 |

Ben E. Keith
5505 Kaepa Court
San Antonio, Texas

Primary Secondary
Alex Landin Mahthew Mcline
Miguel Trevino Sales Rep. Bid Coordinator
361-852-5252 956-220-8261 210-661-7997
ITEM| QTY ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
114 |10 gal |Shineline floor prep, neutralizer $ 4.30 $43.00 $ 887 (% 88.70 | Special Order | Special Order
& conditioner or approval equal SHINEFP1
115 |10 gal [Shineline seal thermosplastic floor | $ 11.30 $113.00 $ 1099 | $ 109.90 | Special Order | Special Order
sealer or approval equal SHINELINE1 NCL-WORLD
CLASS (0570)
116 |50 gal [High frontier thermoplastic floor $ 12.00 $600.00 $ 1197 $ 598.50 | Special Order | Special Order
finish or approval equal ISHINE1 NCL-BRITE
EYES (0521)
117 |50 gal [Bounce back-restorer or approval $10.00 $500.00 $ 651 % 325.50 | Special Order | Special Order
equal BOUNCEL1 NCL-RENU
(0518)
118 |80 gal [Damp mop disinfectant cleaner $6.10 $488.00 $8.90 $ 712.00 | Special Order | Special Order
for restrooms or approval equal DMQ1 IMAGE (0927)
NATURAL Q
DISINF
20z/gal
119 |40 gal [Shineline mutishine cleaner or $5.80 $232.00 $8.55 $ 342.00 | Special Order | Special Order
approval equal SHINEMSC1 NCL-SUPER NAC
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Opened: August 18, 2009
Bud Numnber: 2010-14

COUNTY OF WEBB
Purchasing Department
BID TABULATION

BIDS FOR:

"Annual Contract for Janitorial Supplies”

Gulf Coast Paper
1101 S. Padre Dr.
Corpus Christi, Texas 78405

Patria Int'l Office Supply
301 E. Calton Rd.
Laredo, Texas 78041
956-723-2332 |

Ben E. Keith

5505 Kaepa Court
San Antonio, Texas

Primary Secondary
Alex Landin Mahthew Mcline
Miguel Trevino Sales Rep. Bid Coordinator
361-852-5252 956-220-8261 210-661-7997
ITEM| QTY ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
(0901)
120 |20 gal [Xtraction Il shampoo or approval $5.70 $114.00 $8.52 $ 170.40 | Special Order | Special Order
equal EX1 EDGE PLUS
(0660)
PER/CS $ 45.44
121 |1cs Spartan deformer or approval $ 55.30 $55.30 $ 11.36 | $ 45.44 | Special Order | Special Order
equal DEFOAM1
N/S
122 |20 gal [Plus 5 shampoo or approval equal $ 7.10 $142.00 $ 1022 $ 204.40 | Special Order | Special Order
PLUSS51 BURST PLUS
(0670)
123 |10 gal [SSE Carpet spotter or approval $ 4.70 $47.00 $8.99 $ 89.90 | Special Order | Special Order
equal SSE14 BIO KLEEN
CARPET
SPOTTER
124 |15 gal |[Bonnet & Traffic lane shampoo $ 11.70 | $ 17550 | $ 92.09| $ 136.35 | special Order | special Order
or approval equal BONNET1 All-In-ONE
CARPET
SHAMPOO
125 |5 gal Spartaguard carpet protector or $ 1928 $ 96.40 | $ 3436 | $ 171.80 | Special Order | special Order
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Opened: August 18, 2009
Bud Numnber: 2010-14

COUNTY OF WEBB
Purchasing Department
BID TABULATION

BIDS

FOR:

"Annual Contract for Janitorial Supplies”

Gulf Coast Paper
1101 S. Padre Dr.
Corpus Christi, Texas 78405

Patria Int'l Office Supply
301 E. Calton Rd.
Laredo, Texas 78041
956-723-2332 |

Ben E. Keith
5505 Kaepa Court
San Antonio, Texas

Primary Secondary
Alex Landin Mahthew Mcline
Miguel Trevino Sales Rep. Bid Coordinator
361-852-5252 956-220-8261 210-661-7997
ITEM| QTY ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT |  TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
approval equal SPARTADGARD1 SHIELD PLUS
CONCENTRATED
126 (20 gal |NABC Non-acid bowl cleaner $ 6.00 | $ 120.00 | $ 7.091 % 14180 | $ 1890 | $ 378.00
disinfectant or approval equal NABC1 NCL-BATHROOM 6/1qt
PLUS
127 |3 cs Stainless cleaner aero or approval | $ 3780 | $ 113.40 $35.02 $ 105.06 | $ 3050 | $ 91.50
equal SPARSTSTEEL SYS-2040 6/16/0z
128 |8 cs Window & mirror cleaner spartan $28.30 $226.40 $16.24 $ 12992 | $ 1664 | $ 133.12
concentrated glass or approval SCWC1 #3679 4/1gal
equal 4gal/cs
129 |4cs BriteBoy metal polish $ 7250 | $ 290.00 $84.21 $ 336.84 | $ 36.61 | $ 146.44
BBQY DYM-90218 8/120z
SCRUBS-
POLISHING CLOTH
12pk/18/cs
(216 wipes,
$0.31/ea
130 |50 ea  [Super looped end mop heads med. | $ 400 $ 200.00 $5.65 $ 28250 | $ 950 $ 475.00
size or approval equal MWL UNS-502 ea
BLUE, ORANGE
GREEN
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Opened: August 18, 2009
Bud Numnber: 2010-14

COUNTY OF WEBB
Purchasing Department
BID TABULATION

BIDS FOR:

Patria Int'l Office Supply

Gulf Coast Paper

301 E. Calton Rd.

Ben E. Keith

1101 S. Padre Dr. Laredo, Texas 78041 5505 Kaepa Court
"Annual Contract for Janitorial Supplies” Corpus Christi, Texas 78405 |956-723-2332 San Antonio, Texas
Primary Secondary
Alex Landin Mahthew Mcline
Miguel Trevino Sales Rep. Bid Coordinator
361-852-5252 956-220-8261 210-661-7997
ITEM| QTY ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
131 |50 ea [Super looped end mop heads large $4.86 $243.00 $8.60 $ 430.00 | $ 950 $ 475.00
size or approval equal LWL UNS-503 ea
BLUE,ORANG
GREEN
TOTALS $112,658.94 $ 97,104.35 $ 149,578.23
Total after deducting items not
bidded by the other two
SCHEDULE B
Oil Sorbent Products
PADS
White Melt-Blown 17x19 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
White Sonic Bonded 17x19 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
Gray Sonic Bonded 17x19 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
Yellow Sonic Bonded 17x19 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
SOCKS No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
Gray General Purpose socks No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
Yellow Hazardous Socks
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Opened: August 18, 2009
Bud Numnber: 2010-14

COUNTY OF WEBB
Purchasing Department
BID TABULATION

BIDS FOR:

"Annual Contract for Janitorial Supplies”

Gulf Coast Paper
1101 S. Padre Dr.
Corpus Christi, Texas 78405

Patria Int'l Office Supply
301 E. Calton Rd.
Laredo, Texas 78041
956-723-2332 |

Ben E. Keith
5505 Kaepa Court
San Antonio, Texas

Primary Secondary
Alex Landin Mahthew Mcline
Miguel Trevino Sales Rep. Bid Coordinator
361-852-5252 956-220-8261 210-661-7997
ITEM| QTY ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
REMARKS Reynolds & Tyco items #3, Same or next | day delivery
#12, #13, #14, #15 & #95 will | w/training if | needed and
only be guaranteed until no delivery charge
December 31, 2006. Dart Price increase| will only
items #5, #6, #7 & #8 will occure if mfg.
only be guaranteed until increases prices.

March 31, 2007 w/possible
increase no to exceed 8%
for remainder of bid period
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