Opened: September 21, 2010
Bid Number:2011-32

BIDS FOR:

"Annual Contract for Uniforms"

AL & ROB SALES
801 ELM
LAREDO, TEXAS

Primary

Cintas Corporation

301 Junior Beck

Corpus Christi, Texas 78045

Primary

lopez@cintas.com

ARAMARK UNIFORM SERIVICE
115 N. First Street
Burbank, CA 91502

Dean Scalia

ROBERTO LOPEZ NOE LOPEZ 818-973-37.20
724-4245 361-289-7781 bill.chiaro@uniform.aramark.com
ITEM [QTY ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
Road & Bridge Department
1 80|SHIRT 65% POLY 35% COTTON | $ 1395|$ 1,116.00 | $ 1299 |$ 1,039.20 | $ 16.00 | $ 1,280.00
SHORT SLEEVE SP24 RED CAP ITEM #935 #102
S,M,L, XL
2 80|SHIRT 65% POLY 35% COTTON | $ 1395|$ 1,116.00 | $ 1559 |$ 1,247.20( $ 17.00 | $ 1,360.00
SHORT SLEEVE SP24 RED CAP ITEM #935 #102
XXL,XXXXL,4XL
3 80|SHIRT 65% POLY 35% COTTON | $ 1495|$ 1,196.00 | $ 1399 |$ 1,119.20( $ 17.00 | $ 1,360.00
LONG SLEEVE SP 14 RED CAP ITEM # 935 #101
S,M,L, XL
4 80|SHIRT 65% POLY 35% COTTON | $ 1495|$ 1,196.00 | $ 1659 |$ 1,327.20 | $ 18.00 | $ 1,440.00
LONG SLEEVE SP 14 RED CAP ITEM # 935 #101
2XL,3XL,4XL
5 80|SUPERVISOR SHIRTS $ 1395|$ 1,116.00 | $ 2566 |$ 2,052.80($ 19.00 | $ 1,520.00
SHORT SLEEVE 100% COTTON ITEM # 330 #1218
EDWARDY (1013-007)
S,M,L.XL
6 80|SUPERVISOR SHIRTS $ 1495|$ 1,196.00 | $ 2881 |$ 230480 ($ 20.00 | $ 1,600.00
LONG SLEEVE 100% COTTON ITEM # 330 #1221
(1093-007) MONOGRAM INCL.
2XL,3XL,4XL
7 80|PANTS (9393 RNBOR) $ 1595|$ 1,276.00 [ $ 2899 |$ 231920 $ 25.00 | $ 2,000.00
DICKEY 100% ITEM # 340 #1953
AS PER MEASUREMENTS
8 80|PANTS (993 RNBOR) $ 1595|$ 1,276.00 | $ 1745|$ 1,396.00 | $ 28.00 | $ 2,240.00
DICKEY 100% COTTON ITEM # 894 #1953
AS PER MEASUREMENTS
320|EMBLEMS FOR SHIRTS $ 495]|% 1,584.00
ITEM #935 2EACH

Page 1 of 5




Opened: September 21, 2010
Bid Number:2011-32

AL & ROB SALES Cintas Corporation ARAMARK UNIFORM SERIVICE
BIDS FOR: 801 ELM 301 Junior Beck 115 N. First Street
LAREDO, TEXAS Corpus Christi, Texas 78045 |Burbank, CA 91502
"Annual Contract for Uniforms"
Primary Primary
lopez@cintas.com Dean Scalia
ROBERTO LOPEZ NOE LOPEZ 818-973-37.20
724-4245 361-289-7781 bill.chiaro@uniform.aramark.com
ITEM [QTY ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
80[TOTAL $ 9,488.00 $ 14,389.60 $ 12,800.00
1{NO OVERSIZE FEE
2|{WE DELIVER
3|LOCAL SERVICE
4|WE MEASURE EMPLOYEE WITH
SAMPLE
5|NO ALTERATION CHARGE,LENGTH
& SEWING OF PATCH
ON SUPERVISOR ONLY WEBB CO.
EMBLEM
ON EMPLOYEES COUNTY EMBLEM
& NAME
Building Maintenance
9 34|Long Sleeve Shirt - TAN COLOR $ 1399 | $ 476.66 | $ 17.00 | $ 578.00
ITEM #935 #101
10 26(Long Sleeve Shirt - LIGHT BLUE $ 1399 | $ 363.74 | $ 17.00 | $ 442.00
ITEM # 935 #101
11 5[Long Sleeve Shirt- WHITE COLOR $ 1399 | $ 69.95 | $ 17.00 | $ 85.00
ITEM # 935 #101
12 51|Short Sleeve Shirt- TAN $ 1299 | $ 662.49 | $ 16.00 | $ 816.00
ITEM # 935 #102
13 39|Short Sleeve Shirt - LIGHT BLUE $ 1299 | $ 506.61 | $ 16.00 | $ 624.00
ITEM # 935 #102
14 10(Short Sleeve Shirt- WHITE $ 1299 | $ 129.90 | $ 16.00 | $ 160.00
ITEM # 935 #102
15 15|Pants -Men- KAKI $ 1465 | $ 21975 $ 14.00 | $ 210.00
ITEM #945 #201
16|  75|Pants-Men- NAVY $ 14.65[$ 1,098.75 | $ 14.00 | $ 1,050.00
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801 ELM
LAREDO, TEXAS
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301 Junior Beck

Corpus Christi, Texas 78045

Primary
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ARAMARK UNIFORM SERIVICE
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ROBERTO LOPEZ NOE LOPEZ 818-973-37.20
724-4245 361-289-7781 bill.chiaro@uniform.aramark.com
ITEM [QTY ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
ITEM #945 #201
17 30(Womans Short Sleeve Smocks $ 17.89 536.70 | $ 1750 | $ 525.00
Light Blue ITEM # 964 #3059
18 30{Pants Woman NAVY BLUE $ 14.65 439.50 | $ 14.00 | $ 420.00
ITEM# 945 #201
19 195|Monogragm (2 per Men's Shirt and $ 6.90 1,34550 | $ 6.00 | $ 1,170.00
2 per women's Smocks) ITEM 945 #3059
19|BOOTS (80733) $ 99.99 NO BID
14|SHOES-MEN (83714) $ 89.99 NO BID
6[SHOES-WOMEN (83715) $ 89.99 NO BID
TOTAL 5,849.55 $ 6,080.00
Parks & Grounds Department
23 19]|Long Sleeve Shirt- TAN $ 13.99 265.81 ( $ 17.00 | $ 323.00
ITEM # 935 #101
24 6[Short Sleeve Shirt-TAN $ 12.99 7794 | $ 16.00 | $ 96.00
ITEM #935 #102
25 5[Short Sleeve Shirt-WHITE $ 12.99 64.95| $ 16.00 | $ 80.00
ITEM #935 #102
26 30{Pants-Men- CHOCOLATE $ 14.65 439.50 | $ 14.00 | $ 420.00
ITEM # 945 #201
27 5|Pants- Men- KAKI $ 14.65 73251 $ 14.00 | $ 70.00
ITEM # 945
28 30|Monogram (2 monograms per men $ 6.90 207.00 | $ 6.00 | $ 180.00
Shirt )
6(BOOTS $ 99.99 NO BID NO BID
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Opened: September 21, 2010
Bid Number:2011-32

BIDS FOR:

"Annual Contract for Uniforms"

AL & ROB SALES
801 ELM
LAREDO, TEXAS

Primary

Cintas Corporation

301 Junior Beck

Corpus Christi, Texas 78045
Primary

lopez@cintas.com

115 N. First Street
Burbank, CA 91502

Dean Scalia

ARAMARK UNIFORM SERIVICE

ROBERTO LOPEZ NOE LOPEZ 818-973-37.20
724-4245 361-289-7781 bill.chiaro@uniform.aramark.com
ITEM (QTY ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
TOTAL $ 1,128.45 $ 1,169.00
Note: DELIVERY:
Shirts-Add $2.00 for Sizes 2XL-3XL 30 DAYS AFTER COMPLETED MEASUREMENTS

Add$4.00 for Sizes 4XL-5XL

Pants-Add $3.00 for Sizes 44-50 W

Add-$5.00 for Sizes 52-58 Waisti

Monogram ( 2 per Mens Shirt
2 per Womens shirt) $3.00

and
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