Opened: July 21, 2009
Bid Number:_ 2011-69

COUNTY OF WEBB
Purchasing Department
BID TABULATION

Gonzalez Auto Parts O'Reilly Laredo Wholesale Lef Johnson Ford
BIDS FOR: 4220 San Bernardo 233 S. Patterson 14120zark Drive 501 Koenig
Laredo, Tx 78041 Springfield, Mo 65802 Laredo, Texas 78045 Austin, Texas
"Annual Contract for Brake Pads & Rotors/Drums for Webb Count
Law Enforcement Vehicles"
Joseph A. Gage Jr. Chris George/Bid Coordinator Juan Vallejo Scott Webb/Parts Manager
(956) 724-8177 417-829-5879 956-645-8752 512-697-0689
suebb@Ieifjohnsonford.com
ITEM|QTY ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
40(Front Brakes Pads for 2005-2010 F-150 $ 39.50 | $ 1,580.00 35.99 1439.6| $ 40.00 1,600.00 | $ 35.98 | $ 1,439.20
Engine Model: 4.6 - 5.4
Raybestos model # ATD 1083M WAGNER Mkd # 1083 FM 4U27
Show Mfg& Model Offered: Raybestos Severe Duty MX1083 BENDIX 2V001CA
40|Rear Brakes Pads for 2005-2010 F150 $ 39.50 | $ 1,580.00 | $ 3374 | % 1,349.60 | $ 39.00 1,560.00 | $ 3598 | $ 1,439.20
Engine model 4.6 - 5.4
Raybestos model # ATD 1012M WANGER MKD1012FM 4U27
Show MFG & model Offered: Raybestos Severe Duty MX1012 BENDIX ZV00 A
10|Front Brakes Pads for 2005-2010 F-150 4x4 $ 39.50 | $ 395.00 | $ 3599 | $ 359.90 | $ 40.00 400.00 [ $ 35.98 | $ 359.80
Engine model: 4.6-5.4
Raybestos model # ATD 1083M WAGNER MKD 1088 FM 4U27
Show Mfg & Model Offered: Raybestos Severe Duty MX1083 BENDIX ZVO01CA
10(Rear Brake Pads for 2005-2010 D-150 4x4 $ 39.50 | $ 395.00 | $ 3374 | % 33740 | $ 39.00 390.00 | $ 3598 | $ 359.80
Engine model 4.6-5.4
Raybestos model # ATD 1012 M WAGNER MKD 1012 FM 4U27
Show Mfg & Model offered: Raybestos Severe Duty MX1012 BENDIX 2V001
10|Front Brake Pads for 2004-2008 E150 & E-350 $ 41.00 [ $ 410.00 [ $ 3862 $ 386.20 | $ 45.00 450.00 [ $ 35.98 | $ 359.80
Engine 4.6-5.4 $ 4498 | $ 449.80
Raybestos model # ATD 1045D WAGNER MKD 055 FM 5027
Show Mfg & Model offered: Raybestos Severe Duty MX 1045 BENDIX ZVO01GA
10(Rear Brakes Pads for 2004-2008 E-150 & E350 $ 49.00 | $ 490.00 | $ 38.62 % 386.20 | $ 43.00 430.00 | $ 3598 | $ 359.80
Engine 1.6-5.4
Raybestos model # ATD 1046M WAGNER MKD 802FM Su27
Show Mfg & Model Offered : Raybestos Severe Dut MX 1046 BENDIX ZV200BA
50|Front Brakes Pads for 200-2009 Ford Crwn Vic $ 39.99 | $ 1,999.50 | $ 33.74 | $ 1,687.00 | $ 39.90 1,995.00 | $ 35.98 | $ 1,799.00
Engine 4.6
Raybestos # ADT 931P WAGNER MKD 931 FM 4U27
Show MFG & Model Offered: Raybestos Police Pursuit MX748 BENDIX ZVO001BA
50|Rear Brakes Pads for 200-2009 Ford Crwn Vic $ 39.06 | $ 1,953.00 | $ 33.74 | $ 1,687.00 | $ 39.90 1,995.00 | $ 35.98 | $ 1,799.00
Engine 4.6
Raybestos # ADT 1040 AP WAGNER MKD932FM
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Opened: July 21, 2009
Bid Number:_2011-69

COUNTY OF WEBB
Purchasing Department
BID TABULATION

BIDS FOR:

"Annual Contract for Brake Pads & Rotors/Drums for Webb Count

Law Enforcement Vehicles"

Joseph A. Gage Jr.
(956) 724-8177

Gonzalez Auto Parts
4220 San Bernardo
Laredo, Tx 78041

O'Reilly
233 S. Patterson

Springfield, Mo 65802

Chris George/Bid Coordinator

417-829-5879

Laredo Wholesale
14120zark Drive
Laredo, Texas 78045

Juan Vallejo
956-645-8752

Lef Johnson Ford
501 Koenig
Austin, Texas

Scott Webb/Parts
512-697-0689

Manager

suebb@Ieifjohnsonford.com
ITEM|QTY ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

Show Mfg & Model Offered: Raybestos Police Pursuit MX674 A BENDIX

4|Front Brake Pads for 2001-2005 Ford Expeditions 47.00 188.00 | $ 40.49 | $ 161.96 | $ 45.00 180.00 | $ 3598 | $ 143.92
Engine 4.6-5.4
Raybestos # ATD 702M WAGNER MKD 934 FM
Show Mfg & Model Offered: Raybestos Severe Duty MX 702 BENDIX

4|Rear Brake Pads for 2001-2005 Ford Expeditions 39.00 156.00 | $ 3524 | $ 140.96 | $ 45.00 180.00 | $ 3598 | $ 143.92
Engine 4.6-5.4
Raybestos # ATD # 711M WAGNER MKD 935 FM
Show Mfg & Model Offered: Raybestos Severe Duty MX 711 BENDIX

8|Front Brake Pads for 2007-2010 Chevrolet Tahoe 42.95 343.60 | $ 4574 | $ 365.92 | $ 45.00 360.00 [ NO BID NOBID
Engine 4.8-5.3
Raybestos # ATD 1092 P WAGNER MKD 1092 FM
Show Mfg & Model Offered: Raybestos Police Pursuit QC 1092 BENDIX

8|Rear Brake Pads for 2007-2010 Chevrolet Tahoe 41.95 335.60 | $ 4574 | $ 365.92 | $ 45.00 360.00 [ NO BID NO BID
Engine 4.8-5.3
Raybestos # ATD 1194P WAGNER MKD 1194 FM
Show Mfg & Model Offered: Raybestos Police Pursuit QC1194 BENDIX

18|Front Brake Pads for 2003-2007 Chevrolet Impalas 34.46 692.28 | $ 3862 $ 695.16 | $ 40.00 734.40 | NO BID NO BID
Engine 3.8
Raybestos # ATD 1159P WAGNER MDK699FM
Show Mfg & Model Offerd: Raybestos Police Pursuit| MX 699 BENDIX
18(Rear Brake Pads for 2003-2007 Chevrolet Impalas 37.71 678.78 | $ 4424 | $ 796.32 | $ 40.00 734.40 | NO BID NO BID

Engine 3.8
Raybestos # ATD 698P WAGNER MKD 698FM
Show Mfg & Model Offered; Raybestos Police Pursuit QC 785 BENDIX

4|Brake Pads for 2004-2009 Chevrolet Silverado 45.00 180.00 | $ 4424 | $ 176.96 | $ 45.00 180.00 | NO BID NO BID
Engine 4.8-5.3
Raybestos # ATD 13670 WAGNER MKD 1092FM
Show Mfg & Model Offered: Raybestos Police Pursuit QC792B BENDIX

4|Rear Brake Pads for 2004-2009 Chevrolet Silverado 42.00 168.00 | $ 38.62 % 154.48 | $ 45.00 180.00 | NO BID NO BID
Engine 4.8-5.3
Raybestos # ATD 1194P WAGNER MKD 1194
Show Mfg & Model Offered: Raybestos Police Pursuit MX 1058 BENDIX
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Opened: July 21, 2009
Bid Number:_2011-69

COUNTY OF WEBB

Purchasing Department

BID TABULATION

Gonzalez Auto Parts O'Reilly Laredo Wholesale Lef Johnson Ford
BIDS FOR: 4220 San Bernardo 233 S. Patterson 14120zark Drive 501 Koenig
Laredo, Tx 78041 Springfield, Mo 65802 Laredo, Texas 78045 Austin, Texas
"Annual Contract for Brake Pads & Rotors/Drums for Webb Count
Law Enforcement Vehicles"
Joseph A. Gage Jr. Chris George/Bid Coordinator Juan Vallejo Scott Webb/Parts Manager
(956) 724-8177 417-829-5879 956-645-8752 512-697-0689
suebb@Ieifjohnsonford.com
ITEM|QTY ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
6|Front Brake Pads for 2008 Dodge Charger $ 4195 $ 251.70 | $ 4424 | $ 265.44 | $ 39.95 239.70 | NO BID NO BID
Engine 5.7
Raybestos # ATD 1058P WAGNER MKD 1058 FM
Show Mfg & Model Offered: Raubestos Police Pursuit MX 1058 BENDIX
6|Rear Brak Pads for 2008 Dodge Charger $ 38.09 | $ 22854 | $ 4124 | $ 24744 | $ 42.00 256.80 | NO BID NO BID
Engine 5.7
Raybestos # ATD 1057 AP WAGNER MKD 1057 FM
show Mfg & model Offered: Raybestos Police Pursuit MX1057B BENDIX
TOTAL $ 12,025.00 $ 11,003.46 12,225.30 INC. BID
ROTORS AND DRUMS
40|Front Rotors for 2005- F150 $ 125.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 69.14 | $ 2,765.60 | $ 89.00 3,560.00 | $ 150.53 | $ 6,021.20
Engine Model: 4.6- 5.4
Raybestos # 680178 BRAKE BEST #145519
Show Mfg & Model offered: Raybestos Severe Duty 680178RGS BENDIX
40|Rear Rotor/Drum fro 2005 2010 F-150 $ 55.00 | $ 2,200.00 | $ 2499 | $ 999.60 | $ 39.00 1,560.00 | $ 53.98 | $ 2,159.20
Engine Model 4.6-5.4
Raybestos # 680182 BRAKE BEST #145521
show Mfg & Model Offered: Raybestos Severe Duty 680182RGS BENDIX
10(Front Rotor for 2005-2010 F150 4x4 $ 49.00 | $ 490.00 | $ 42.48 | $ 424.80 | $ 45.00 450.00 | $ 53.98 | $ 539.80
Engine Model # 51.6- 5.4
Raybestos# 680732 BRAKE BEST #145527
Show Mfg & Model Offered: Raybestos Severe Duty 680180RGS BENDIX
10|Rear Rotor for 2005-2010 F-150 4x4 $ 55.00 | $ 550.00 | $ 2499 | $ 249.90 | $ 39.00 390.00 [ $ 53.98 | $ 539.80
Engine Model 4.6-5.4
Raybestos # 680182 BRAKE BEST #145521
Show Mfg & Model Offered : Raybestos Severe Duty 680182RGS BENDIX
10(Front Rotors for 2004-2008 E-150, E-350 $ 61.32 | $ 613.20 | $ 28.32 | % 283.20 | $ 59.00 590.00 | $ 53.98 | $ 539.80
Engine 4.6 - 5.4
Raybestos: 66445 BRAKE BEST #145057
Show Mfg & Model Offered: Raybestos Severe Duty 66445RGS BENDIX
10|Rear Rotors/Drums for 2004-2008 E150-E350 $ 49.08 | $ 490.80 | $ 47.47 | $ 47470 | $ 59.00 590.00 | $ 71.98 | $ 719.80
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Opened: July 21, 2009
Bid Number:_2011-69

COUNTY OF WEBB
Purchasing Department
BID TABULATION

BIDS FOR:

Gonzalez Auto Parts
4220 San Bernardo
Laredo, Tx 78041

O'Reilly
233 S. Patterson
Springfield, Mo 65802

Laredo Wholesale
14120zark Drive
Laredo, Texas 78045

Lef Johnson Ford
501 Koenig
Austin, Texas

"Annual Contract for Brake Pads & Rotors/Drums for Webb Count
Law Enforcement Vehicles"
Joseph A. Gage Jr. Chris George/Bid Coordinator Juan Vallejo Scott Webb/Parts Manager
(956) 724-8177 417-829-5879 956-645-8752 512-697-0689
suebb@Ieifjohnsonford.com
ITEM|QTY ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
Engine 4.6-5.4
Raybetos: 680363 BRAKE BEST #145251
Show Mfg & Model Offered: Raybestos Severe Duty 680363RGS BENDIX
50|Front Rotors for 200-2010 Ford Cwn Vic $ 79.97 | $ 3,998.50 | $ 3794 | % 1,897.00 | $ 49.00 2,450.00 | $ 4498 | $ 2,249.00
Engine 4.6
Raybestos # 680110 P BRAKE BEST #145326
Show Mfg & Model Offered: Raybestos Police Pursuit 66744RGS BENDIX
50|Rear Rotors/Drum fro 200-2010 Ford Crwn Vic $ 39.95 | $ 1,997.50 | $ 2817 | $ 1,408.50 | $ 35.00 1,750.00 | $ 4498 [ $ 2,249.00
Engine 4.6
Raybestos # 680129 BRAKE BEST #145353
Show Mfg & Model Offered: Raybestos Severe Duty 66595RGS BENDIX
4|Front Rotors for 2001 - 2005 Ford Expeditions $ 56.00 | $ 224.00 | $ 24.16 | $ 96.64 | $ 45.00 180.00 | $ 53.98 | $ 215.90
Engine 4.6- 5.4
Raybestos # 680105 BRAKE BEST #145367
Show Mfg & Model Offered: Raybestos Severe Duty 66943RGS BENDIX
4|Rear Rotors/Drums for 2001-2005 Ford Expeditions | $ 4585 $ 183.40 | $ 25.03 | $ 100.12 | $ 45.00 180.00 | $ 53.98 | $ 215.92
Engine 4.6-5.4
Raybestos # 680106 BRAKE BEST #145414
Show Mfg & Model Offered: Raybestos Severe Duty 66943RGS BENDIX
8|Front Rotors for 2007-2010 Chevrolet Tahoe $ 5731 | $ 458.48 | $ 38.76 | $ 310.08 | $ 52.00 416.00 | NO BID NO BID
Engine 4.6-5.4
Raybestos # 580279P BRAKE BEST #145582
Mfg & Model Offered: Raybetos Police Pursuit 58027RGS BENDIX
8|Rear Rotors/Drum for 2007-2010 Chevrolet Tahoe | $ 52.00 | $ 416.00 [ $ 4997 | $ 399.76 | $ 59.00 472.00 | NO BID NO BID
Engine 4.6 -5.4
Raybestos # 580422P BRAKE BEST #145729
Show Mfg & Model Offered: Raybestos 580422RGS BENDIX
18|Front Rotors for 2003-2007 Chevrolet Impalas $ 7498 | $ 1,349.64 | $ 2499 | $ 449.82 [ $ 35.00 630.00 | NO BID NO BID
Engine 3.8
Raybestos # 580403 P BRAKE BEST #145150
Show Mfg & Model Offered: Raybestos Police Pursuit 56641RGS BENDIX
18|Rear Rotors/ Drum for 2003-2007 Chevrolete Impalg $ 3424 | $ 616.32 | $ 21.66 | $ 389.88 | $ 35.00 630.00 | NO BID NO BID
Engine 3.8
Raybestos # 56629 BRAKE BEST #145155
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Opened: July 21, 2009
Bid Number:_2011-69

COUNTY OF WEBB
Purchasing Department
BID TABULATION

BIDS

"Annual Contract for Brake Pads & Rotors/Drums for Webb Count

FOR:

Law Enforcement Vehicles"

Gonzalez Auto Parts

4220 San Bernardo
Laredo, Tx 78041

Joseph A. Gage Jr.
(956) 724-8177

O'Reilly
233 S. Patterson

Springfield, Mo 65802

Chris George/Bid Coordinator

417-829-5879

Laredo Wholesale
14120zark Drive
Laredo, Texas 78045

Juan Vallejo
956-645-8752

Lef Johnson Ford
501 Koenig
Austin, Texas

Scott Webb/Parts
512-697-0689

Manager

suebb@Ieifjohnsonford.com
ITEM|QTY ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
Show Mfg & Model Offered : Raybestos Severe Duty 56629RGS BENDIX
4|Front Rotors for 2004-2009 Chevrolet Silverado $ 4651 | $ 186.04 | $ 2749 | $ 109.96 | $ 52.00 208.00 [ NO BID NO BID
Engine 4.8-5.3
Raybestos # 56825 BRAKE BEST #145582
Show Mfg & Model Offered: Raybestos Severe Duty 56825 RGS BENDIX
4|Rear Rotors/Drums for 2004-2009 $ 49.00 [ $ 196.00 | $ 3582 (% 143.28 | $ 59.00 236.00 | NO BID NO BID
Engine 4.8-5.3
Raybestos # 56827 BRAKE BEST #145729
Show Mfg & Model Offered: Raybestos Severe Duty 56827RGS BENDIX
6|Front Rotors for 2008 Dodge Chargers $ 7498 | $ 449.88 [ $ 4164 | $ 249.84 | $ 63.00 189.00 | NO BID NO BID
Engine 5.7
Raybestos # 780256P BRAKE BEST #145651
Show Mfg & Model Offered: Raybestos Pursuit 78025RGS BENDIX
6|Rear Brake Pads for 2008 Dodge Chargers $ 57.39 | $ 34434 | $ 3831 (% 229.86 | $ 65.00 390.00 | NO BID NO BID
Engine 5.7
Raybestos # 780395 BRAKE BEST #145739
Show Mfg & Model Offered: Raybestos Server Duty 780254RGS BENDIX
TOTAL $ 19,764.10 $ 10,982.54 14,871.00 INC BID
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Opened: July 21, 2009
Bid Number:_2011-69

COUNTY OF WEBB
Purchasing Department
BID TABULATION

BIDS FOR:

"Annual Contract for Brake Pads & Rotors/Drums for Webb Count

Law Enforcement Vehicles"

Gonzalez Auto Parts
4220 San Bernardo
Laredo, Tx 78041

Joseph A. Gage Jr.
(956) 724-8177

O'Reilly
233 S. Patterson
Springfield, Mo 65802

Chris George/Bid Coordinator
417-829-5879

Laredo Wholesale
14120zark Drive
Laredo, Texas 78045

Juan Vallejo
956-645-8752

Lef Johnson Ford
501 Koenig
Austin, Texas

Scott Webb/Parts Manager
512-697-0689

suebb@Ieifjohnsonford.com

ITEM|QTY

ITEM DESCRIPTION

UNIT
PRICE

EXT
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXT
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXT
PRICE

UNIT EXT
PRICE PRICE
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Joseph A. Gage Jr.
(956) 724-8177

O'Reilly
233 S. Patterson
Springfield, Mo 65802

Chris George/Bid Coordinator
417-829-5879

Laredo Wholesale
14120zark Drive
Laredo, Texas 78045

Juan Vallejo
956-645-8752

Lef Johnson Ford
501 Koenig
Austin, Texas

Scott Webb/Parts Manager
512-697-0689

suebb@Ieifjohnsonford.com
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BENDIX BRAKES AND ROTORS
PROTEC BRAKES AND ROTORS
AMGAUCEL/TINKER BEARINGS AND SEALS




