
Opening Date: 01.18.2012 Webb County Ben E. Keith Labatt Food Service Sysco 

RFP 2012-88 Purchasing Dept. c/o Melissa Fleming c/o Enrique Alvarado c/o Gary Brooks

3 month Contract for Meats Bid Tabulation 5505 Kaepa 902 N. Expressway 77 PO Box 18364

San Antonio, TX 78218 Harlingen, TX 78550 San Antonio, TX 78218

210-661-7997 956-286-4934 210-444-3417

Price Schedule Form msfleming@benekeith.com ealvarado@labattfood.com dresch.rebecca@satx.sysco.com

Primary Secondary 

Item Description Item # or Equal

Estimated 

Qty (for 

Contract 

Term)

Unit Pack

Estimated LBs 

to be 

purchased Price Per LB

Extended Price per 

LB
Price Per LB

Extended Price 

per LB
Price Per LB

Extended 

Price per LB

1 Bacon Ends & Pieces 530813 1 case 1-15# 15 $1.72 $25.76 1.44$           21.54$                   $1.60 $24.00

2 Bacon Hickory Smoked Thin 530869 20 Case 3-100ct/Tyson Price per Case $10.29 $205.80 45.91$         918.20$                 $30.40 $608.00

3 Bacon Layout Random 530566 25 Case 15lb H Valve 375 $2.16 $811.76 2.29$           858.75$                 $2.66 $998.18

4 Bacon slab sl 1/30 lb 530566 77 Box 1 / 15LB 1155 $2.16 $2,500.24 2.97$           3,435.38$              $2.67 $3,088.47

5 Beef cutlet cu 50/3.2 oz 507016 36 Box 50 / 3.2 OZ  360 $5.22 $1,878.78 5.07$           1,825.12$              $5.06 $1,820.16

6 Beef Ground 73/27 506086 300 LB 8-10# 300 $0.26 $78.82 2.56$           768.75$                 $2.40 $720.00

7 Beef Ground Fine 80/20 506083 314 Lb 8-10#Cw Ibp 314 $0.29 $92.35 2.44$           765.38$                 $2.82 $885.48

8 Beef Ground Fine 81/19 506083 300 lb 8-5lb 300 $0.07 $19.85 2.44$           731.25$                 $3.15 $945.90

9 Beef Liver Sliced 518060 25 Case 10lb Ibp 250 $1.94 $485.29 1.95$           487.81$                 $1.86 $465.00

10 Beef Paties 3/1 Ctf 75/25 506961 30 Case 30-5.33oz Holten 299.8125 $2.65 $795.74 2.49$           746.05$                 $2.55 $765.42

11 Beef Patties Charbroiled 509353 942 Case 120-2oz 14130 $2.94 $41,525.58 1.05$           14,887.08$            $2.89 $40,765.05

12 Beef Patties Charbroiled 509155 500 Case 102-2.5oz Gorgeous 7968.75 $2.94 $23,418.75 1.05$           8,395.71$              $2.89 $22,989.84

13 Beef scalded t 1/50 lb 518211 55 Box 1 / 50 LB   2750 $0.99 $2,717.65 0.98$           2,681.25$              $0.95 $2,612.50

14 Beef Salisbury Charbroiled 509414 474 Case 114-3oz Portnpak 10131.75 $2.89 $29,284.55 2.10$           21,303.52$            $2.94 $29,787.35

15 Beef Salisbury Flambroiled 50944 10 case 114-3oz advance 213.75 $2.89 $617.82 2.10$           449.44$                 $2.94 $628.43

16 Beef steak fin 128/1.25 510225 14 Box 160 / 1OZ 140 $2.31 $322.82 1.81$           253.68$                 $2.41 $336.98

18 Beef Steak Finger Pc 510413 320 Case 160-1 oz Advance 3200 $2.43 $7,774.12 1.81$           5,798.39$              $2.41 $7,702.40

19 Beef Stew Meat in Cube 506031 25 Case 10lb Supreme 250 $3.99 $997.06 3.90$           973.84$                 $2.89 $723.50

21 Beef tongue wh 1/30# 502050 20 Box 1 / 25#CW   500 $0.12 $59.29 2.93$           1,462.50$              $2.88 $1,440.00

22 Bologna sliced 12/1 lb 547106 47 Box 12 / 1 LB    564 $2.78 $1,565.93 3.09$           1,740.15$              $3.19 $1,798.03

23 Brisket Bnls Nr #120 500245 132 Lbs Catch Ibp 132 $0.04 $5.12 3.01$           397.69$                 $2.82 $372.24

24 Cat Fish Nuggets BRD 455030 10 case 1-15# 150 $1.94 $291.18 2.41$           361.54$                 $2.06 $309.30

25 Chicken Breast Cordon Blue 375335 24 Case 24-7.5oz L Aster 270 $6.81 $1,839.18 3.89$           1,049.77$              $4.90 $1,323.00

27 Chicken Breast Fillet Mesq 487620 64 Case 64-2.75oz Tyson 704 $3.56 $2,509.55 3.47$           2,442.62$              $3.74 $2,630.85

28 Chicken Breast Pattie Brd 487705 60 Case 60-3.18oz Tyson 715.5 $2.38 $1,701.90 1.22$           872.96$                 $3.93 $2,811.92

29 Chicken Chunks Dinosaur Cn 487025 250 Case 250-.70oz/Tyson 2734.375 $2.33 $6,369.49 2.32$           6,335.74$              $2.72 $7,432.03

30 Chicken Chunks Lt Brd Cn 487026 255 Case 255-.65oz/Tyson 2641.640625 $2.52 $6,667.67 1.24$           3,268.65$              $2.43 $6,408.62

31 Chicken Diced 3/4" Iqf 487057 20 Case 10lb.Tyson 200 $3.12 $623.53 3.20$           639.53$                 $2.67 $533.20

32 Chicken Drumstick Fc Brd 487574 100 Case 18# Tyson 1800 $3.43 $6,168.24 3.16$           5,691.76$              $4.13 $7,432.20

33 Chicken Fajita Thigh Meat 487088 25 Case 5lb Tyson 125 $7.63 $953.24 2.79$           348.84$                 $4.08 $510.25

34 Chicken Fried Chicken 487717 90 Case 40-4oz Qtf 900 $3.51 $3,155.29 4.33$           3,899.63$              $3.48 $3,133.80

35 Chicken leg me 4/10 lb 487856 67 Box 4 / 10 LB.  2680 $1.04 $2,774.59 0.96$           2,579.50$              $1.20 $3,216.00

36 Chicken Leg Patties Cn 487532 102 Case 102-2.75oz/Tyson 1788.1875 $2.24 $4,009.98 1.89$           3,383.57$              $0.65 $1,156.96
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37 Chicken pulled 1/10 lb 487865 322 Box 1 / 10 LB.  3220 $3.12 $10,038.82 3.44$           11,068.75$            $2.73 $8,800.26

38 Chicken 40# leg qtrs. 488030 79 Box 1 / 40LB 3160 $0.74 $2,323.53 0.69$           2,172.50$              $0.76 $2,395.28

39 Chicken Leg Quarters Frozen 488030 50 Case 10lb Tyson 500 $2.94 $1,470.59 0.69$           343.75$                 $0.62 $311.50

40 Chicken meat 2/5 lb 488004 10 Box 250 / .64 OZ  100 $1.34 $133.76 3.20$           319.77$                 $2.88 $288.20

41 Chicken nugget 245/.64 487023 15 Box 250 / .64 OZ  150 $2.08 $312.35 1.24$           185.52$                 $1.60 $240.00

42 Chicken Pattie 3oz Preckd 487715 60 Case 60-3oz Tyson 675 $2.36 $1,589.68 1.22$           823.54$                 $3.66 $2,473.20

43 Chicken Salad Chips 3/8" 487853 15 Case 1-10# 150 $3.00 $450.00 3.23$           484.76$                 $3.24 $485.25

44 Chicken Tenderloin Brd Fe 487452 20 Case 5lb Tyson 100 $10.13 $1,012.71 1.32$           132.14$                 $5.10 $510.10

45 Chicken Thighs Iqf 487160 96 Case 96-4.75oz/Tyson 2736 $1.87 $5,121.79 1.51$           4,120.67$              $1.57 $4,295.52

46 Chicken ThighsIqf Raw 487189 635 Case 96-5.2oz/Tyson 19812 $1.47 $29,142.58 1.51$           29,838.74$            $1.57 $31,104.84

47 Chicken Twists Rtc 488292 25 Case 5lb Tyson 125 $4.73 $591.18 1.48$           185.32$                 $2.37 $295.63

48 Frank All Beef 8/16" 536022 160 Case 80-2oz Tyson 1600 $2.99 $4,781.18 3.07$           4,917.07$              $3.09 $4,936.00

49 Ham Buffet Style 538008 3,500 lb 10-12#c Tyson 3500 $0.21 $730.88 2.20$           7,682.93$              $2.89 $10,115.00

50 Ham Diced 1/4 In Iqf 538710 25 roll 5lb Doskocil 125 $5.20 $650.00 2.67$           333.84$                 $3.10 $387.50

51 Ham Diced Cooked 538709 25 Case 5lb Wilson 125 $6.52 $814.71 2.67$           333.84$                 $3.08 $385.00

52 Ham sliced 384 4/3 lb 538037 28 Box 4 / 3 LB.   336 $3.18 $1,067.29 3.91$           1,312.59$              $3.10 $1,039.92

53 Ham Sliced .50oz Each 538037 30 Case 2lb Deli Sliced 60 $3.18 $190.59 3.91$           234.39$                 $4.18 $250.56

55 Meatball Charbroiled Cn 522410 800 Case 320-.5oz Advance 8000 $3.10 $24,800.00 2.26$           18,042.18$            $3.07 $24,520.00

57 Meatball Charbroiled 522505 320 Case 320-.5oz Advance 3200 $3.07 $9,814.59 2.26$           7,216.87$              $3.07 $9,808.00

58 Meatball Charbroiled 522507 320 Case 320-.5oz Advance 3200 $3.71 $11,877.65 2.26$           7,216.87$              $3.07 $9,808.00

59 Meatloaf beef 76/3.15 509618 18 Box 76 / 3.15OZ 269.325 $3.05 $822.76 2.78$           749.65$                 $3.25 $875.31

62 POLLOCK FILLET 4/10 lb 457522 33 Case 1 / 10 LB   330 $3.95 $1,304.86 3.72$           1,226.92$              $1.82 $601.76

63 POLLOCK ALASKA 40/3.6 oz 455742 549 Case 40 / 3.6 OZ. 4941 $3.72 $18,363.08 2.33$           11,512.53$            $2.94 $14,531.48

65 Pork boston bu 1/60 lb 532203 35 Box 1 / 60#CW   2100 $0.03 $54.76 1.82$           3,823.08$              $1.68 $3,528.00

66 Pork riblet fr 1/30 lb 532340 20 Box 1 / 30 LB.  600 $1.53 $917.65 0.94$           561.54$                 $1.14 $684.00

67 Roast Beef Sliced .5oz 501048 25 Case 2Lb Hormel 50 $6.40 $320.00 5.04$           251.88$                 $5.94 $296.85

68 Sausage pattie 108/1.5 540008 20 Box 128 / 1.5 OZ  240 $2.28 $546.35 2.32$           557.08$                 $2.52 $604.80

69 Sausage choriz 2/5 lb 541205 98 Box 2 / 5 LB.   980 $1.94 $1,902.35 1.73$           1,697.91$              $2.53 $2,478.42

70 Sausage link b 160/1 oz 541413 25 Box 200 / .8 OZ   250 $3.95 $988.24 2.33$           583.52$                 $3.19 $797.00

71 Turkey Breast Smoked Sknls 492156 25 Lbs 9# Avg Carolina 225 $0.43 $97.06 4.85$           1,091.25$              $2.94 $661.50

72 Turkey 20 2/20/2022 490512 28 Box 2 / 20-22 # 1232 $0.05 $64.62 1.36$           1,678.60$              $1.36 $1,675.52

73 Turkey 1/10 lb 492949 419 Box 2 / 5 LB    4190 $2.76 $11,584.12 1.03$           4,294.75$              $2.53 $10,596.51

75 Turkey Franks 8/1 492029 25 Case 5lb Butrball 125 $2.94 $367.65 1.02$           127.91$                 $1.85 $230.88

76 Turkey Franks 10/1 492078 20 case 1-10# 200 $1.49 $298.82 1.23$           246.00$                 $1.26 $252.80

78 Turkey hens 12 4/12-14# 490109 25 Box 4 / 12-14#CW 1400 $0.03 $36.89 1.40$           1,960.00$              $1.29 $1,806.00

79 Turkey Meat Pulled White 492944 20 Case 10lb Carolina 200 $6.18 $1,235.29 5.56$           1,112.50$              $6.52 $1,303.60

80 Turkey Sausage Patties 492773 15 case 128-1.25 oz 150 $3.52 $527.65 3.30$           495.35$                 $2.21 $331.50

82 Turkey Sliced .7oz Or 492059 25 Case 2lb Jennie O 50 $4.53 $226.47 3.45$           172.67$                 $4.66 $233.00

83 Tukey Smoked Sliced 492298 25 case 6-2# 200 $4.81 $962.35 3.45$         690.70$                 $4.36 $872.40

GRAND TOTAL $299,781.76 ########## $311,186.12



*** "No Bid" Items are removed from final tallies 

17 Beef steak fri 40/4 oz 487717 48 Box 40 / 4 OZ    40 35.06 $1,402.40 1.74$           69.79$                   no bid #VALUE!

20 Beef Stew Meat 1/2 In Cube 506040 57 Case 10Lb Supreme 570 39.88 $22,731.60 3.93$           2,240.23$              no bid #VALUE!

26 Chicken Breast Fil Hickory 487644 40 Case 4Oz Ok Foods 4 46.47 $185.88 5.20$           20.82$                   no bid #VALUE!

54 Meatball Beef And Chicken 522515 320 Case 320-.5oz Bonici 3200 18.22 $58,304.00 2.27$           7,255.81$              no bid #VALUE!

56 Meatball Charbroiled .5o 522439 320 Case 320-.5oz Armour 3200 25.53 $81,696.00 2.26$           7,216.87$              no bid #VALUE!

60 Meatloaf Beef Charbroiled Site 522410 76 Case 320-5oz Advance 7600 31 $235,600.00 3.87$           29,391.54$            no bid #VALUE!

61 Meatloaf porti 76/3.15 509618 307 Box 76 / 3.15OZ 4593.4875 45.82 $210,473.60 2.78$           12,785.65$            no bid #VALUE!

64 Pork pattie ch 50/3.2 oz 544251 58 Box 50 / 3.2 OZ  580 23.19 $13,450.20 1.60$           925.37$                 no bid #VALUE!

74 Turkey Diced White 492949 25 Case 5lb Carolina 125 27.65 $3,456.25 2.27$           283.43$                 no bid #VALUE!

77 Turkey ham dic 492681 20 Box 1 / 10 LB   200 19.65 $3,930.00 3.00$           600.00$                 no bid #VALUE!

81 Turkey Sliced or .5oz Frsh 492059 20 Case 2lb Deli Sliced 40 54.35 $2,174.00 2.91$           116.28$                 no bid #VALUE!
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